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Gmail - Re: order

M Gmail

Re: order
1 message

Daniel Lear <daniel@humanmeduk.com>
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

19 June 2019 at 17:16

Hi Kate, cancel the 3.5 cannula for Reigate. | have sent them 3 from here and will send another 2 once | receive some
more. Please place an order on for me for stock of the same cannula ASAP credit Reigate account for the wrong item
and charge for these 3.5 cannula

Kind regards

Daniel Lear

Area sales manager
07496479083

Human Med UK

On 19 Jun 2019, at 10:12, Kate Giriffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hi Dan,

Are you able to clarify as per my previous email?
Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Giriffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted

to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please

reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Tue, Jun 18, 2019 at 11:59 AM Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hi Dan,

Just to confirm. You will provide Davina from Reigate with 1 x 1500121-5 as our last one is going to

OK Medical.

As | understand it, you still want me to put an order on for 1 x 1500121-5, but no goods to be shipped,

just for us to invoice?
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| have asked Derek to order stock.
| await your reply.

Thank you.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths
http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or

omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,

please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Tue, Jun 18, 2019 at 10:45 AM Humanmeduk <logistic@humanmeduk.com> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Daniel Lear <daniel@humanmeduk.com>

Date: Tue, 18 Jun 2019 at 10:29

Subject: Re: order

To: <tom@humanmeduk.com>

Cc: <sales@humanmeduk.com>, <logistic@humanmeduk.com>

That’s it
Kind regards
Daniel Lear

Area sales manager
07496479083

Human Med UK

On 18 Jun 2019, at 10:28, <tom@humanmeduk.com> <tom@humanmeduk.com> wrote:

Apologies.

The part number for the 3.5 infiltration cannulas is 1500121-5

Tom
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From: Daniel Lear <daniel@humanmeduk.com>

Sent: 18 June 2019 10:14

To: sales@humanmeduk.com; logistic@humanmeduk.com; tom@humanmeduk.com
Subject: Fwd: order

Slight issue with the Harvey street skin Reigate order. What they wanted is 3.5 sterile
Bodyjet cannula not beauli cannulas. Can we please get these out to them for latest
end of play Thursday and arrange collection of the others?

Kind regards
Daniel Lear
Area sales manager

07496479083

Human Med UK

Begin forwarded message:

From: Davina Saunders <davina@hsscr.co.uk>
Date: 18 June 2019 at 06:48:15 BST

To: Daniel Lear <daniel@humanmeduk.com>
Subject: Re: order

Please send me a box of the infiltration cannula as requested in my first
email. | do not have the box and | need them for a case on Friday.
Please send without further delay! Kind regards Davina

Sent from my iPhone

On 17 Jun 2019, at 22:41, Daniel Lear <daniel@humanmeduk.com>
wrote:

You have 3.5 infiltration. This is for first phase.
Aspiration are for second phase. Harvesting. Is this what

you mean? Product number will be on the box. If you can
send me that | will know which one you need.

Kind regards
Daniel Lear
Area sales manager

07496479083

Human Med UK

On 17 Jun 2019, at 08:41, Davina Saunders
<davina@hsscr.co.uk> wrote:
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Hi Daniel,

| need infiltration cannulas please — if they
are 3.5 its okay but definitely infiltration

Kind regards,

Davina Saunders

<image001.jpg>

T: 01737 247246
E-mail: davina@hsscr.co.uk

Website: www.surreyskinclinic.com

This message is intended only for the use of the
Addressee and may contain information that is
privileged and confidential. If you are not the
intended recipient, you are hereby notified that
any dissemination of this communication is
strictly prohibited. If you have received this
communication in error, please erase all copies
of the message and its attachments and notify
us immediately. Thank you.

From: Daniel Lear
<daniel@humanmeduk.com>
Sent: 14 June 2019 14:24
To: Davina Saunders
<davina@hsscr.co.uk>
Subject: Re: order

Hi Davina,

Ok, that’s a shame. The infiltration cannulas
only come in 3.5mm. | think what you need
is the 3.8mm aspiration cannulas.

If you can confirm this then | will place the
order. If you can send the ones back that
you have then we will credit your account.

In future, if you can quote the part number
then this will stop any confusion.

Kind regards

Daniel Lear
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Area sales manager

07496479083

Human Med UK

On 13 Jun 2019, at 10:57, Davina Saunders
<davina@hsscr.co.uk> wrote:

Hi Daniel

the infiltration cannulas arrived
today and unfortunately these
are the incorrect ones

| wanted the Bodyjet machine

1 box x 5 infiltration cannula
3.8

| received beauli infiltration

Kind regards,

Davina Saunders
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T: 01737 247246
E-mail: davina@hsscr.co.uk

Website: www.surreyskinclinic.
com

This message is intended only
for the use of the Addressee and
may contain information that is
privileged and confidential. If you
are not the intended recipient,
you are hereby notified that any
dissemination of this
communication is strictly
prohibited. If you have received
this communication in error,
please erase all copies of the
message and its attachments
and notify us immediately. Thank
you.

From: Davina Saunders
Sent: 03 June 2019 18:12
To: Daniel Lear
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<daniel@humanmeduk.com>
Subject: order

Hello Daniel
May | please order
1 x box of serres suction bags

1 box of bodyjet infiltration
cannulas

Thank you

Davina

Kind regards,

Davina Saunders
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T: 01737 247246

E-mail: davina@hsscr.co.uk

Website: www.surreyskinclinic.

com

This message is intended only
for the use of the Addressee and
may contain information that is
privileged and confidential. If you
are not the intended recipient,
you are hereby notified that any
dissemination of this
communication is strictly
prohibited. If you have received
this communication in error,
please erase all copies of the
message and its attachments
and notify us immediately. Thank
you.
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