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M Gma" Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Fwd: Short application for EVO

1 message

Daniel Lear <daniel@humanmeduk.com> 29 October 2018 at 12:41

To: orders@viamed.co.uk
Cc: sales@humanmeduk.com

Morning,

Can we prepare an order of 580001 for Hassan Soueid please. See email below.

Also, please let me know what is outstanding on his account as he should only have x2 single applicators to pay off.
Kind regards

Daniel Lear

Area sales manager

07496479083

Human Med UK

Begin forwarded message:

From: Hassan Soueid <dr.hsoueid@hotmail.com>
Date: 25 October 2018 at 07:59:52 BST

To: Daniel Lear <daniel@humanmeduk.com>
Subject: Short application for EVO

Dear Daniel,

| hope you are well and having a great time .

| would like to order the short application which (comes box of 5 )normally made for Echo but it fits EVO
water jet but | don’t know the code for this applicators .

Can you kindly please send me the code number in order to order the right ones.

Many thanks

Regards
Hassan

KIND REGARDS
DR HASSAN SOUEID
07764391750

On 24 Aug 2018, at 09:51, Daniel Lear <daniel@humanmeduk.com> wrote:

My pleasure.....

Just get in contact with Anthony direct to arrange any training...

Enjoy your vacation!

From: Hassan Soueid <dr.hsoueid@hotmail.com>
Sent: 24 August 2018 09:44
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To: Daniel Lear <daniel@humanmeduk.com>
Subject: Re: Introduction

Dear Daniel,
Many thanks for email .
That is great , | really appreciate your help and support .

Ps.l am going away from 25th of August till 10th of September

Regards

Hassan

KIND REGARDS

DR HASSAN SOUEID
07764391750

On 24 Aug 2018, at 09:38, Daniel Lear <daniel@humanmeduk.com> wrote:

Good morning Hassan,

I hope all is well. As we discussed at our last meeting, Mr Anthony
MacQuillan who is based in Bristol has been using the Bodyjet EVO for fat
grafting for many years. | have copied him into this email as an introduction
to any training you may want to organise with him.

Any issue, please let me know.

KR

Daniel Lear

Area Sales Manager

+44 (0)7496479083

daniel@humanmeduk.com
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UK Office: 17 Station Raod, Cross Hills, Keighley, West Yorkshire. BD20 7DT

Head Office: Wilhelm-Hennemann-Str. 9, D- 19061, Schwerin, Germany.
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Telephone +44 (0) 208 712 1192 Fax +44 (0) 1535 635 582

www.humanmeduk.com

DISCLAIMER: This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended for the
attention and use of the individual or entity to which they are addressed. No copy or other intellectual
rights to any material attached to this email, either inline or as an attachment are transferred to the
recipient unless explicitly stated. If you have received this email in error, please reply to inform us
accordingly, prior to deleting this message. This email and its contents remain the property of
Humanmed Uk Limited.

PLEASE CONSIDER THE ENVIRONMENT BEFORE PRINTEING THIS EMAIL
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