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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: Your urgent order 
1 message

Humanmeduk <logistic@humanmeduk.com> Wed, Jun 20, 2018 at 2:49 PM
To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

 
---------- Forwarded message ---------- 
From: Hassan Soueid <dr.hsoueid@hotmail.com> 
Date: 20 June 2018 at 14:07 
Subject: Re: Your urgent order 
To: Humanmeduk <logistic@humanmeduk.com> 
 
 
Dear Kate,  
Many thanks for your email.  
Yes both items are correct . 
Please send me the proforma and I will pay it today  
Thanks for your help  
KIND REGARDS  
DR HASSAN SOUEID  
07764391750 
 
> On 20 Jun 2018, at 12:26, Humanmeduk <logistic@humanmeduk.com> wrote: 
>  
> Good afternoon Dr Soueid, 
>  
> Further to our telephone conversation just now, Tom has advised me to create a proforma invoice for you.  If you
are able to pay today by BACS, we would aim to ship tomorrow, for delivery Friday. 
>  
> As we were sidetracked yesterday regarding what your order was for, please could you email me with your
requirements?   
>  
> I believe it was for Serres suction bag, box of 24 (item number 57187, price £94.55 each) and EVO WAL application
sets for Bodyjet 370cm (box of 5) (item number 570001-5, price £677.64). 
>  
> Apologies if I am incorrect, also we did not discuss quantities! 
>  
> Many thanks, I await to hear from you. 
>  
> Kind regards, 
>  
> Kate Griffiths 
> Humanmed 
> 0208 712 1192 
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