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Emily Hanson <viamed.emily.hanson@gmail.com>

Fwd: Payment from Nottingham University Hospitals NHS Trust to 00377300 Viamed 
1 message

Main Account <info@viamed.co.uk> Wed, Jul 12, 2017 at 12:09 PM
To: Emily Hanson <viamed.emily.hanson@gmail.com>

---------- Forwarded message ---------- 
From: <payments@nuh.nhs.uk> 
Date: 12 July 2017 at 12:07
Subject: Payment from Nottingham University Hospitals NHS Trust to 00377300 Viamed 
To: info@viamed.co.uk 
Cc: NUHSupplier@nuh.nhs.uk 

The following remittance details the payment of £170.4 made to 'Viamed' on 12-JUL-2017 by
BACSE.  

Can you please check that your supplier details are correct, if any changes are required please
email these to payments@nuh.nhs.uk quoting your supplier number.  

12-JUL-2017 Integra Finance System 
PL Payment Remittance 12:07:54

Header Details
Company Number: 1
Payment Reference: BCE0292124
Payment Method: BACSE
Supplier: 00377300 

Viamed 
15 Station Road 
Cross Hills 
Keighley 
West Yorkshire 
BD20 7DT

Payment Run Date: 12-JUL-2017
Payment Amount: 170.40
Supplier Bank Sort
Code: 207842

Supplier Bank
Account: 00906662

Supplier Bank
Account Name: VIAMED

Line Details
Reference Type Transaction Date Your Reference Amount Balance
0051753992 INV 04-Jan-2017 IN148627 170.40 170.40
Grand Total 170.40
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The information contained in this email may be the subject of public disclosure under the 
Freedom of Information Act 2000 - unless legally exempt from disclosure, the 
confidentiality of this email and your reply cannot be guaranteed. 

Copyright of this email and any attachments created by us remains vested in the 
Nottingham University Hospitals NHS Trust. 

This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for  
the use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed.  

This footnote also confirms that this email message has been swept by  
anti-virus software for the presence of known computer viruses. 

Nottingham University Hospitals NHS Trust 
City Hospital campus | Hucknall Road | Nottingham | NG5 1PB | Tel: 0115 969 1169 
QMC campus | Derby Road | Nottingham | NG7 2UH | Tel: 0115 924 9924 
If you have received this email in error please notify the sender.  
TRACKING ID:B5966030b0000.000000000001.0002.mml - 12:07:55  12/07/2017

This message has been scanned for malware.

Please find attached remittance details for payment 

*** 
*** Integra Workflow 
*** [XML101] 
*** Remittance Details 
*** 

The information contained in this email may be the subject of public disclosure under the
Freedom of Information Act 2000 - unless legally exempt from disclosure, the 
confidentiality of this email and your reply cannot be guaranteed. 

Copyright of this email and any attachments created by us remains vested in the 
Nottingham University Hospitals NHS Trust. 

This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for 
the use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. 

This footnote also confirms that this email message has been swept by 
anti-virus software for the presence of known computer viruses. 

Nottingham University Hospitals NHS Trust 
City Hospital campus | Hucknall Road | Nottingham | NG5 1PB | Tel: 0115 969 1169 
QMC campus | Derby Road | Nottingham | NG7 2UH | Tel: 0115 924 9924 

If you have received this email in error please notify the sender. 

-------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 

Tracking ID: B5966030b0000.000000000001.0002.mml - 12:07:55  12/07/2017 

This message has been scanned for malware. 
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--  
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email: info@viamed.co.uk
Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634 542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635 582

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended soley for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete
in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------
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