
Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Re: r22avg order
1 message

CRYPTONFIX <cryptonfix@gmail.com> Thu, Jan 15, 2026 at 12:29 PM
To: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

wasn't aware, but go ahead.

On Thu, 15 Jan 2026 at 11:52, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good morning, 

Thank you for your order. Please be aware that the price for the R-22AVG increased on the 1st January 2026 - an email
was sent regarding this in October 2025:

https://mailchi.mp/9aada8796b26/viamed-pricing-update-17993251?e=

The price is now £18.60 per sensor (plus VAT). Carriage remains at £12.00 plus VAT.

Please can you let me know you are aware of the new price and happy for us to proceed with your order?

Kind regards

Sophie Lines
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email: sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk
Tel:   44 (0)1535 634 542
Fax:   44 (0)1535 635 582

Please note: My working days are Tuesday-Friday

Check out our product portfolio at:
www.viamed.co.uk/productportfolio

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete
in the subject line or call  44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------

On Thu, Jan 15, 2026 at 10:32 AM Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: CRYPTONFIX <cryptonfix@gmail.com>
Date: Thu, 15 Jan 2026 at 10:20
Subject: r22avg order
To: VIAMED <info@viamed.co.uk>

Please supply 100 x r22avg asap.
Any issues please let me know, thanks.
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SENDER DETAILS:
TUNINGSUPPLIES (CRYPTONFIX LTD. T/A)
UNIT 9, EAVES COURT
BONHAM DRIVE, EUROLINK
SITTINGBOURNE, KENT.
ME10 3RY  U.K.
Office: 01795-426481  Mobile: 07540-624242
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