16/12/2025, 12:30 Gmail - Re: Your 4 order confirmations

M G ma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Your 4 order confirmations
1 message

Consumeda UAB <consumeda3@gmail.com> 16 December 2025 at 11:53
To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Unboxed.
Aleh

BT, 16 gek. 2025r. B 13:45, Kate Giriffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>:
Hi again Aleh,

Sorry for the delay, please could | ask if you would like the 10 x 0110582 - OOM204 boxed or
unboxed?

Many thanks.
Kind regards

Kate Griffiths
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Check out our product portfolio at:
www.viamed.co.uk/productportfolio

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted
to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call 44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, 15 Dec 2025 at 09:31, Consumeda UAB <consumeda3@gmail.com> wrote:
OK, will wait.
Aleh

nH, 15 pek. 2025r. B 11:25, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>:
Thank you Aleh, please do not pay that one, please pay the one | will send you very soon ©)

Kind regards
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-a:r-4181664492614271883%7Cmsg-f:18516656771951... 1/8


mailto:kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
mailto:kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/productportfolio
http://www.viamed.co.uk/productportfolio
http://twitter.com/ViamedLtd
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:consumeda3@gmail.com
mailto:kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

16/12/2025, 12:30 Gmail - Re: Your 4 order confirmations

Kate Griffiths
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Check out our product portfolio at:
www.viamed.co.uk/productportfolio

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call 44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, 15 Dec 2025 at 09:16, Consumeda UAB <consumeda3@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Kate,
| will surely pay it tonight when come back from the customer.
Kind regards,
Aleh

nH, 15 gek. 2025r. B 11:07, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>:
Hi Aleh,

Please can | ask if you have paid for MVM160642 (carriage charge relating to your outstanding
order) as the carriage charge may change to include these other items. If you have, please let
me know.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Giriffiths

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.
http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Check out our product portfolio at:
www.viamed.co.uk/productportfolio

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd
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Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing
list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call 44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, 15 Dec 2025 at 09:01, Consumeda UAB <consumeda3@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Kate,
You can send me a Proforma just now.
According to the current lead time, the sensors OOM204 will be ready for the shipment along
with the rest of SpiroQuant H (4 boxes) ? Anyway, we are expecting to get them together as
the both items are for the same customer.
Kind regards,
Aleh

nH, 15 gek. 2025r. B 10:47, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>:
Thank you for your reply Aleh.

Would you like a proforma invoice for 10 x 0110582 - OOM204 to be shipped by
themselves when they are in stock?

The lead time would be approximately 5-6 weeks from date of payment.
Kind regards

Kate Griffiths
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Check out our product portfolio at:
www.viamed.co.uk/productportfolio

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is
unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action
taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our
mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call 44 (0)1535 634542
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On Mon, 15 Dec 2025 at 08:35, Consumeda UAB <consumeda3@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Kate,
| spoke to our customer. They need "original" Envitec sensors OOM204.
Kind regards,
Aleh

nT, 12 pek. 2025r. B 11:41, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>:
Good morning Aleh,

These sensors are not in stock - 0110582 - OOM204. We can offer an alternative.
The R-47V - part number 0110047 is in stock, it costs €55.20 each.

Is this a sensor you would accept? | have attached the data sheet.
Kind regards

Kate Griffiths
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Check out our product portfolio at:
www.viamed.co.uk/productportfolio

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is
unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action
taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our
mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call 44 (0)1535 634542

On Fri, 12 Dec 2025 at 09:04, Consumeda UAB <consumeda3@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Kate,
| have one more order for you - Envitec oxygen sensors OOM204 - 10 pcs. Please,
send me Proforma to pay.
So, do you think we can combine the shipment of these sensors with the rest of the
4310503 ?
Kind regards,
Aleh

nT, 12 nek. 2025r. B 10:57, Kate Giriffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>:
Good morning Aleh,
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Please see attached proforma invoice for the payment to ship the 4 x 4310503
when they are available (mid January 2026).

We will email the tracking number for the 203 x 0110583 and 9 x 4310503 next
week.

Many thanks.
Kind regards

Kate Griffiths
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Check out our product portfolio at:
www.viamed.co.uk/productportfolio

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is
unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any
action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be
unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from
our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call 44 (0)1535
634542

On Wed, 10 Dec 2025 at 11:14, Consumeda UAB <consumeda3@gmail.com>
wrote:
Dear Kate,
Please, ship now what is available at the moment. Separately, you can issue
proforma for next shipment.
Kind regards,
Aleh

On Wed, 10 Dec 2025 at 10:23, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
wrote:

Good morning Aleh,

| am pleased to say that we can ship most of your orders next week.

We can ship as follows:

203 x 0110583 and 9 x 4310503.

If you require 4 x 4310503 shipping separately, | would need to send
you a proforma invoice to pay for shipping (I have not worked the
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amount out). Alternatively, the outstanding 4 x 4310503 could be
shipped with your next order.

Please let me know how you would like to proceed.
Kind regards

Kate Griffiths
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Check out our product portfolio at:
www.viamed.co.uk/productportfolio

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
Itis intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is
unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or
any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and
may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed
from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call 44
(0)1535 634542

On Thu, 4 Dec 2025 at 13:34, Consumeda UAB <consumeda3@gmail.com>
wrote:

Dear Kate,

Thanks for the information.

As available, please ship OOM103-1 sensors.

Kind regards,

Aleh

On Thu, 4 Dec 2025 at 14:53, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
wrote:
Good afternoon Aleh,

We anticipate the lead times for your orders to be as follows:

0110583 - OOM103-1 mid December 2025
4310503 Flowsensor SpiroQuant H mid January 2026

Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.
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http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Check out our product portfolio at:
www.viamed.co.uk/productportfolio

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally
privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone
else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying,
distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is
prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be
removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line
or call 44 (0)1535 634542

On Tue, 18 Nov 2025 at 12:04, Consumeda UAB
<consumeda3@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Kate,
Thanks for the information.
Please, keep me updated regarding the shipment.
Kind regards,
Aleh

BT, 18 Hos6. 2025 1. B 13:58, Kate Griffiths
<kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>:
Good afternoon Aleh,

| have started a new email thread to enclose your order
confirmations for your four orders.

Thank you for today's payment.

We will ship all the orders together when stock is available.
Kind regards

Kate Giriffiths

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Check out our product portfolio at:
www.viamed.co.uk/productportfolio
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Meet us at MEDICA 2025:
17th — 20th November, Duisseldorf
UK Pavilion — Hall 16, Stand H03-1

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally
privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by
anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying,
distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on
it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be
removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the
subject line or call 44 (0)1535 634542
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