
Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: Order
1 message

Michael Lamb <michael.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk> 15 December 2025 at 13:26
To: kate.griffiths@vandagraph.co.uk, aqib.majeed@vandagraph.co.uk, sophie.lines@vandagraph.co.uk

Tcan you process this please

the VN202 is a Manual (7910110)

Kind regards
Michael

Michael Lamb
Vandagraph Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email michael.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Company registered in England, No. 02332105.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.vandagraph.com/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to
be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634900
-----------------

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Scuba Support - Eddy van Vliet <info@scubasupport.nl>
Date: Mon, 15 Dec 2025 at 13:15
Subject: Order
To: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Hey Ryan, hope you are well!

Can you send me

2x vn202 that always stays on ( so auto shut off disabled)
2x r17van
2x sensor r-22van
2x r33de

I am in Mexico, but the company is open.
Merry christmas!

Met vriendelijke groet / Kind regards,

Eddy van Vliet 
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Scuba Support

Franciscusweg 10-1

1216SK Hilversum

The Netherlands

Openingstijden

Phone: +31 648511848            Info@ScubaSupport.nl
   www.ScubaSupport.nl
________________________________________________

KvK:321167830000                      VAT#  NL001959467B52

EORI Nr: NL5181168523

Bank Account: Multicorp 

IBAN: NL30 RABO 0123851734 - BIC: RABONL2U
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