05/12/2025, 08:26 Gmail - Re: PROFORMA INVOICE REQUEST -MASTERMED
M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: PROFORMA INVOICE REQUEST -MASTERMED

1 message

Mastermed Equipment Trading LLC <mastermd@emirates.net.ae> 4 December 2025 at 18:15
To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Kate,
Please add proforma invoice for following Oxygen sensor also
R-43V OXYGEN SENSOR -QTY 5

Thanks & regards
ROSHIL
MASTERMED

On 25/11/25 03:02 PM, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Good morning Roshil.
Thank you for your reply.

Please see updated proforma invoice attached. | have added the $70.92 to the carriage line and
removed the 2 x MAX-250.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Check out our product portfolio at:
www.viamed.co.uk/productportfolio

Meet us at MEDICA 2025:
17th — 20th November, Disseldorf
UK Pavilion — Hall 16, Stand H03-1

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
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