
Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

RE: VN202 mkII Oxygen Analyser (7910100)
1 message

John Clarke <john@jwciltd.com> 24 November 2025 at 15:40
To: "ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk" <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>
Cc: "sales@vandagraph.co.uk" <sales@vandagraph.co.uk>, Kerry <kerry@jwciltd.com>

Hi Ryan

 

I could I order

 

2 off

 

VN202 (analyser and sensor) = £156 each EXW x 1
R-17VAN = £50 each EXW x 2
And spare cable sensor cable x 1

 

 

 

Kind Regards

John Clarke
Managing Director

JWCI Limited

 

Manufacturing:

12 Holding Units

Barlaston Road

ST3 4AL
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Telephone: 01889 507177

Fax: 01889 507176

Mobile: 07976 782141

Email: john@jwciltd.com

Website: www.jwciltd.com

 

DISCLAIMER: This email sent by JWCI Limited and may contain confidential, legally privileged or trade secret
information which is protected by law. It is intended for the named recipient only. If you are not the intended
recipient please notify us by telephone immediately +44 (0)1889 507177 or return it to us by e-mail, confirming
that it has been deleted from your system and any hard copies destroyed. You must not use, disclose or distribute,
copy, print or rely on any information contained in this e-mail. We do not, to the extent permitted by law, accept
any liability (whether in contract, negligence or otherwise) for any virus infection and/or external compromise of
security and/or confidentiality in relation to transmissions sent by e-mail. As with any internet communication,
this one may not be secure against interception or modification

 

Registered Office:

Fourways

Folebank

Fole

Uttoxeter

ST14 5EW

 

 

 

From: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>
Sent: 12 September 2025 14:25
To: John Clarke <john@jwciltd.com>
Cc: sales@vandagraph.co.uk; Kerry <kerry@jwciltd.com>
Subject: Re: VN202 mkII Oxygen Analyser (7910100)

 

Hi John

 

Thank you very much for your email.
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In your industry I would expect you to get 2+ years out of one of our O2 sensors. We recommend putting sensors in to
use within 6 months of purchase, so we would not recommend purchasing spare sensors just yet. Please also note
that we nearly always have these sensors available from stock, so in most cases we can dispatch the same day as
receiving an order.

 

VN202 (analyser and sensor) = £156 each EXW
R-17VAN = £50 each EXW x 2

 

We currently supply a few companies that provide welding equipment, in these cases they often add their own
accessories for pumping the sample gas out of the gap between the pipes, we supply some T Pieces to some of
them.

 

Are there any accessories or adapters you require? I may be able to help if I can understand what tubing or
accessories you are wanting to connect the sensor to.

 

I look forward to hearing from you, please do not hesitate to contact me if you have any questions.

 

Kind regards

Ryan

 

 

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

 

On Fri, 12 Sept 2025 at 12:19, John Clarke <john@jwciltd.com> wrote:

Hi

 

 

We are looking at purchasing some Oxygen Analysers and are looking at purchasing 5 to 10 off, we have tested
the VN202 mkII Oxygen Analyser (7910100) for our application to check that there is no oxygen left in our pipe
work for welding.

 

How long does the replacement sensor last if its left in its packaging, so we can keep in our stores

 

 

VN202 mkII Oxygen Analyser (7910100) Can you quotation for 5 off and 10off
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R-17VAN Oxygen Sensor (0110217) Can you quotation for 5 off and 10off

 

 

 

Kind Regards

John Clarke
Managing Director

JWCI Limited

 

Manufacturing:

12 Holding Units

Barlaston Road

ST3 4AL
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Registered Office:

Fourways

Folebank

Fole

Uttoxeter
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ST14 5EW
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