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M Gma“ Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: PROFORMA INVOICE REQUEST -MASTERMED

1 message

Mastermed Equipment Trading LLC <mastermd@emirates.net.ae> 21 November 2025 at 15:43
To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Kate,

Please proceed with The oxygen sensor MAX-250 WITHOUT O ring is part number 0110428.
The price is $61.90 each EXW.

billing address and shipping address is the same

Thanks & regards
Roshil
MASTERMED

On 21/11/25 07:26 PM, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good afternoon Roshil,

Thank you for your email.

Please could | ask which MAX-250 you require?

Part number 0110425 is the oxygen sensor MAX-250 WITH O ring. The price is $60.10 each
EXW.

The oxygen sensor MAX-250 WITHOUT O ring is part number 0110428. The price is $61.90
each EXW.

Shall | use these addresses:

| await your reply.
Kind regards

Kate Griffiths
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.
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http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Check out our product portfolio at:
www.viamed.co.uk/productportfolio

Meet us at MEDICA 2025:
17th — 20th November, Dulsseldorf
UK Pavilion — Hall 16, Stand H03-1

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call 44 (0)1535 634542

On Fri, 21 Nov 2025 at 14:50, Mastermed Equipment Trading LLC
<mastermd@emirates.net.ae> wrote:
Dear Kate ,

Please send me proforma invoice for following

1. 0014753 Viamed SMARTsat Paediatric Silicone Fing - QTY 1
2. R45V OXYGEN SENSOR -QTY 5

3. R23V OXYGEN SENSOR -QTY 10

4. R177MED OXYGEN SENSOR -QTY 5

5. MAX-250 OXYGEN SENSOR -QTY 2

Thanks & regards
Roshil
MASTERMED

On 15/05/25 04:25 PM, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Good afternoon Roshil,
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