
Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

PROFORMA INVOICE REQUEST -MASTERMED
1 message

Mastermed Equipment Trading LLC <mastermd@emirates.net.ae> 21 November 2025 at 14:50
To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Kate ,

  Please send me proforma invoice for following 

1.   0014753  Viamed SMARTsat Paediatric Silicone Fing  - QTY 1

2.  R45V  OXYGEN SENSOR  -QTY 5 

3. R23V OXYGEN SENSOR -QTY 10 

4. R17MED OXYGEN SENSOR -QTY 5 

5. MAX-250 OXYGEN SENSOR -QTY 2 

Thanks & regards
Roshil
MASTERMED 

On 15/05/25 04:25 PM, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Good afternoon Roshil,

Just a quick email to ask if you received the email on Monday from Ryan?  We have a sales lead
for R-17MED sensors and we wanted to know if you would be happy to quote them?

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the
office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email
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