
Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: Purchase Order 40080171 from 2gether Support Solutions
1 message

2GETHERPROCUREMENT (2GETHER SUPPORT SOLUTIONS LIMITED)
<2gether.2getherprocurement@nhs.net>

21 November 2025 at
09:13

To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>, "MAZANIK, Lukasz (2GETHER SUPPORT SOLUTIONS
LIMITED)" <l.mazanik@nhs.net>

Good morning

 

Please find attached updated PO as requested.

 

Regards

Karen

 

Karen Hamilton

 

 

 

 

  Karen Hamilton
Information Assistant 2gether Support Solutions

DD 01233 651 957  723 1957 karen.hamilton13@nhs.net

 

MY WORKING HOURS ARE WEDNESDAY, THURSDAY AND FRIDAY 8:00- 16:30

 

2gether Support Solutions Limited is a company registered in England and Wales with Company Number
11385580. Registered Office: Management Offices, William Harvey Hospital, Kennington Road,
Willesborough, Ashford, Kent, England, TN24 0LZ. VAT No. GB 297 8726

 
Please consider your environmental responsibility. Before printing this e-mail message, ask
yourself whether you really need a hard copy.

 

 

From: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Sent: 20 November 2025 13:42
To: 2GETHERPROCUREMENT (2GETHER SUPPORT SOLUTIONS LIMITED)
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<2gether.2getherprocurement@nhs.net>; MAZANIK, Lukasz (2GETHER SUPPORT SOLUTIONS LIMITED)
<l.mazanik@nhs.net>
Subject: Re: Purchase Order 40080171 from 2gether Support Solutions

 

  This message originated from outside of NHS.net Connect. Please do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognise the sender and know the content is safe.

Good afternoon,

 

Thank you for your PO 40080171.

 

Please could I advise you that the correct price for the R-30V is £68.70 each when purchasing one.

 

The other price breaks are as follows:

 

1 = £ 68.70 2 = £ 65.30 each 3-10 = £ 61.90 each 11 or more = £ 58.40 each

 

If it helps, you paid the correct price earlier this month (PO 40079497) after your team had agreed the correct
price.

 

Please let me know if you would like me to proceed.

 

Many thanks.

 

Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Check out our product portfolio at:
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www.viamed.co.uk/productportfolio

 

Meet us at MEDICA 2025:
17th – 20th November, Düsseldorf
UK Pavilion – Hall 16, Stand H03-1

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call  44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Thu, 20 Nov 2025 at 13:31, Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: BUSINESSWORLDSERVER <ekfc.bw@nhs.net>
Date: Thu, 20 Nov 2025 at 13:24
Subject: Purchase Order 40080171 from 2gether Support Solutions
To: <orders@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: <l.mazanik@nhs.net>

 

** Please do not reply to this email. This mailbox is not monitored and you will not receive a response. **
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------
Purchase Order: 40080171

From: 2Gether Support Solutions Ltd
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------

Please find attached our Purchase Order in PDF format.

We may also have attached additional information where relevant.
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If you have any questions regarding this order then please reply to: 2gether.2getherprocurement@nhs.net

If you would rather call us, the telephone number is 01233 633331 ext 723-1908.

Ensure that you quote our Purchase Order Number on all correspondence. Thank-you.

Information for Contractors – Please ensure that any employee visiting our site has read our Safeguarding
Booklet, please click this link: Information for Contractors

__________________________________________________________________________________
The attached Purchase Order is in PDF format. To ensure that you can read it, you must have at least Adobe
Reader Version 6 (or equivalent) installed on your PC.

Adobe Reader can be downloaded from http://get.adobe.com/reader/

If you have technical problems with this email or the attachments are missing please email
ekfc.agradmin@nhs.net

DO NOT USE THIS EMAIL ADDRESS FOR ORDER QUERIES.

**DISCLAIMER**
This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the use of the individual or
entity to whom they are addressed.

If you are not the intended recipient, be advised that you have received this email in error and that any use,
dissemination, forwarding, printing or copying of this email is strictly prohibited.

If you have received this email in error please notify us immediately at the following email address:
ekfc.agradmin@nhs.net

************************************************************
************************** ******************************

This message may contain confidential information. If you are not the intended
recipient please:
i) inform the sender that you have received the message in error before
deleting it; and
ii) do not disclose, copy or distribute information in this e-mail or take any
action in relation to its content (to do so is strictly prohibited and may be
unlawful).
Thank you for your co-operation.

NHS.net Connect is the secure email, collaboration and directory service
available for all NHS staff in England. NHS.net Connect is approved for
exchanging patient data and other sensitive information with NHS.net Connect
and other accredited email services.

For more information and to find out how you can switch visit Joining NHS.net
Connect – NHS.net Connect Support

************************************************************
************************** ******************************

This message may contain confidential information. If you are not the intended
recipient please:
i) inform the sender that you have received the message in error before deleting
it; and
ii) do not disclose, copy or distribute information in this e-mail or take any
action in relation to its content (to do so is strictly prohibited and may be
unlawful).
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Thank you for your co-operation.

NHS.net Connect is the secure email, collaboration and directory service available
for all NHS staff in England. NHS.net Connect is approved for exchanging patient
data and other sensitive information with NHS.net Connect and other accredited
email services.

For more information and to find out how you can switch visit Joining NHS.net Connect –
NHS.net Connect Support

Viamed Ltd 40080171.pdf
279K
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