11/10/25, 3:24 PM Gmail - Fwd: Information ref. R116P82-001

Nl Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>
Fwd: Information ref. R116P82-001

1 message

Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk> 10 November 2025 at 15:16

Reply-To: ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>, Agib Majeed <agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>, Sophie Lines
<sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Hi, please can we send them a proforma invoice for the following:

12x
0110420 Oxygen sensor MAX-14 (Fluke version) - Maxtec R116P82-001
EUR €76.30 each EXW

| will address the other issues.

Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

Check out our product portfolio at:
www.viamed.co.uk/productportfolio

Meet us at MEDICA 2025:
17th — 20th November, DUsseldorf
UK Pavilion — Hall 16, Stand H03-1

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: José Ramoén Garcia [Admon. Sorevan] <joseramon.garcia@sorevan.com>
Date: Mon, 10 Nov 2025 at 15:09

Subject: RE: Information ref. R116P82-001

To: <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>

Cc: <imports@sorevan.com>

Dear Ryan,

We have noticed that the address of the European representative on your label does not match with Declaration of
conformity address. | am attaching a screenshot for your reference.
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