11/6/25, 12:32 PM Gmail - Fwd: PURCHASE ORDER Ref:10/98459/2025

M Gmall Aqib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed2@gmail.com>

Fwd: PURCHASE ORDER Ref:10/98459/2025

Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> Thu, Nov 6, 2025 at 12:14 PM
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>, Aqib Majeed <agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Hi, please process the proforma invoice.

If you use the same box dimensions as Viamed uses for sensors, it will be okay.
The sensors weigh 120g each

Thank you
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: LandSea Tech Ltd - Sales <sales@landseatech.co.uk>
Date: Wed, 5 Nov 2025 at 15:17

Subject: PURCHASE ORDER Ref:10/98459/2025

To: <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Purchase Order #10/98459/2025

Dear Ryan,

Thank you very much for the quotation.

| am pleased to confirm order as follows

[tem] Qty | Unit | Description 1

1 6.000{ EACH |Description: VANDAGRAPH, R-33VAN-4 Oxygen
Sensor (0110235) compatible with ANALOX 92
Mfg PartNo.: R-33VAN-4

Manufacturer Name: VANDAGRAPH

2 6.000{ EACH [Descnption: VANDAGRAPH, R-33VAN-2 Oxygen
Sensor (0110241) compatible with ANALOX 92
Mfg PartNo.. R-33VAN-2

Manufacturer Name: VANDAGRAPH
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Kindly acknowledge the order with expected ready date, HS CODE and Country of Origin.

Please advise packing details when the order is ready, DO NOT dispatch the order to our office without prior instructions from us.

Kind Regards,

Pauline Sands

Office Manager
Direct Dial: +44 203 744 7900

LANDSEA TECH LTD

WAL ANDsEAS
T : +44 203 744 7900

—— F : +44 203 744 7902
— |

TECH DEVELOPMENT
TURBOTWIN™ Air Starters E : sales@landseatech.co.uk

Authorised Distributor & Service Source

W : www.landseatech.co.uk

Company Registration: 09396610
VAT No: GB203 9679 94
E.O.R.I No: GB203 967 994 000

Delivery address: Rear of 63 Station Road, London N21 3NB, United Kingdom

Registered address: 47 Firs Park Gardens, London N21 2PX, United Kingdom

—_ Wl | EXPORTING s TradeNet
=5 ProcureShip I
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This email, together with any attachments, is for the exclusive and confidential use of the addressee(s). Any other distribution, use or reproduction without the senders' prior consent is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender by email immediately and delete the
message from your computer without making any copies.

b% Please consider the environment before printing this email.
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From: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>
Sent: 05 November 2025 10:26

To: LandSea Tech Ltd - Sales <sales@landseatech.co.uk>
Subject: Re: Ref:10/98459/2025

Dear Leonard

Lead time would be 7-10 working days.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Wed, 5 Nov 2025 at 08:32, LandSea Tech Ltd - Sales <sales@landseatech.co.uk> wrote:
Ref:10/98459/2025

Dear Ryan,

Thanks for your quotation.

Kindly re-confirm the quoted lead time.

In case of questions please don't hesitate to contact us.

Warm Regards,

Leonard Pinheiro

Direct Dial: +44 203 744 7904
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AL ANDSEAS

LANDSEATECH LTD
47 Firs Park Gardens
London N21 2PX, United Kingdom

Tel: +44 203 744 7900 Fax: +44 203 744 7902
Email: sales@landseatech.co.uk www.landseatech.co.uk

Company Registration: 09396610 VAT No: GB203 9679 94 E.O.R.I No: GB203 967 994 000
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This email, together with any attachments, is for the exclusive and confidential use of the addressee(s). Any other distribution, use or reproduction without the senders' prior consent is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender by email inmediately and delete the
message from your computer without making any copies.

b% Please consider the environment before printing this email.

From: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>
Sent: 30 October 2025 19:40

To: LandSea Tech Ltd - Sales <sales@landseatech.co.uk>
Subject: Re: Ref:10/98459/2025

Hi Leonard

Thank you very much for your email.

Trade price for both the R-33VAN-2 and R-33VAN-4 is £75 each EXW
Lead time would be approximately 7-10 working days.

Best regards

Ryan
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Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Thu, 30 Oct 2025 at 14:05, LandSea Tech Ltd - Sales <sales@landseatech.co.uk> wrote:

Ref:10/98459/2025

Please quote your best price and lead time for

Line # Part # Full Description Machinery Maker Qty Unit Type
VANDAGRAPH, R-33VAN-4 Oxygen Sensor (0110235)

1 R-33VAN-4 VANDAGRAPH 6 EACH
compatible with ANALOX 92
VANDAGRAPH, R-33VAN-2 Oxygen Sensor (0110241)

2 R-33VAN-2 VANDAGRAPH 6 EACH

compatible with ANALOX 92

In case of questions please don't hesitate to contact us.

Warm Regards,

Leonard Pinheiro

Direct Dial: +44 203 744 7904

AL AaNDsEAS

LANDSEA TECH LTD
47 Firs Park Gardens
London N21 2PX, United Kingdom

Tel: +44 203 744 7900 Fax: +44 203 744 7902
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Email: sales@landseatech.co.uk www.landseatech.co.uk

Company Registration: 09396610 VAT No: GB203 9679 94 E.O.R.I No: GB203 967 994 000
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This email, together with any attachments, is for the exclusive and confidential use of the addressee(s). Any other distribution, use or reproduction without the senders' prior consent is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please notify
the sender by email immediately and delete the message from your computer without making any copies.

P Please consider the environment before printing this email.
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