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M G ma|l Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: New customer message on 5 October 2025 at 11:58 am
1 message

SOURABH ANAND <25dp0115@iitism.ac.in> 5 November 2025 at 17:34

To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Ms. Griffiths,
Good afternoon,

Thank you for your follow-up. Yes, the quotation QVM159402 is still required. The procurement process
was under consideration at our institute, and we are interested in ordering the required unit/quantity.

Additionally, since we are unable to make a direct bank transfer, it would be greatly appreciated if
the payment could be processed through a secure payment link or alternate online method.

Thank you for your patience and continued support.

Kind regards,

Sourabh Anand

Research Scholar

Department of Mining Engineering

Indian Institute of Technology (Indian School of Mines), Dhanbad — 826004, India
Qe +91-8340723183

] 25dp0115@iitism.ac.in

On Wed, Nov 5, 2025 at 9:43 PM Kate Giriffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good afternoon,
Just a quick email to ask if quotation QVM159402 is still required?
Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Giriffiths
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.
http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Check out our product portfolio at:
www.viamed.co.uk/productportfolio

Meet us at MEDICA 2025:
17th — 20th November, Dusseldorf
UK Pavilion — Hall 16, Stand H03-1

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
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