11/5/25, 7:42 AM Gmail - Re: Request for offer

Nl Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Request for offer
1 message

Meoprun BostHoB <amelideood@abv.bg> 4 November 2025 at 19:28
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

| saw | made mistake

Number for flow sensor is
https://www.viamed.online/collections/flowsensors/products/4310007-flowsensor-a-
flowsensor-apc

AMELID LTD
Bulgaria, Sofia 1614
35 Madzharica str.

+359887370730

Or: Kate Griffiths

OTtHocHo: Re: Request for offer
Ho: leopru bosiHoB
U3npaTeHo Ha: 18:49

Good afternoon,

| am sorry to say that we are unable to supply part number 4310004. It may be something we can supply in
the future.

Part number 6018854 - Sampling Tube - External Sidestream costs €3.30 each EXW. The lead time would
be approximately 2-4 weeks.

Please let me know if | can be of any further assistance.
Many thanks.
Kind regards

Kate Giriffiths
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b587 1a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f: 1847865777763971120%7Cmsg-f:1847889247806953333&...  1/3



11/5/25, 7:42 AM Gmail - Re: Request for offer

Check out our product portfolio at:
www.viamed.co.uk/productportfolio

Meet us at MEDICA 2025:
17th — 20th November, Diisseldorf
UK Pavilion — Hall 16, Stand HO3-1

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call 44 (0)1535 634542

On Tue, 4 Nov 2025 at 16:14, Kate Griffiths < kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good afternoon,

Thank you for your email.

| am unable to give you pricing and availability until | have spoken with our commercial director.
| will email again as soon as | have the information.
Thank you for your patience.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Check out our product portfolio at:
www.viamed.co.uk/productportfolio

Meet us at MEDICA 2025:
17th — 20th November, Disseldorf
UK Pavilion — Hall 16, Stand HO3-1

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd
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Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to
be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call 44 (0)1535 634542

On Tue, 4 Nov 2025 at 13:15, Main Account < office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Meopru BositHoB <amelideood@abv.bg>
Date: Tue, 4 Nov 2025 at 13:10

Subject: Request for offer

To: < office@viamed.co.uk>

Dear colleagues,

| need offer for :

1. part number 4310004 - flow sensor box of 5 - 6 boxes

2. part number 6018854 - CO2 line box of 10 - 6 boxes

AMELID LTD
Bulgaria, Sofia 1614
35 Madzharica str.

+359887370730

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b587 1a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1847865777763971120%7Cmsg-f:1847889247806953333&...  3/3



