
Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: [EXT] New price list for the 8010006 rEvo CR22D oxygen sensor
1 message

Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> 30 October 2025 at 14:38
To: Steve Nixon <steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com>
Cc: office@vmsecure.me.uk
Bcc: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

Hi Steve,

PO 4536012759 is for 600 x 8010006.  I will go with 600

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Check out our product portfolio at:
www.viamed.co.uk/productportfolio

Meet us at MEDICA 2025:
17th – 20th November, Düsseldorf
UK Pavilion – Hall 16, Stand H03-1

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to
be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call  44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------
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On Thu, 30 Oct 2025 at 14:15, Steve Nixon <steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com> wrote:
Please process the attached VST orders from rEvo.

Process at the 2026 prices (£29.35), I will remind them about the new prices.

500 x 8010006  set shipment date to 5/1/26
500 x 8010006  set shipment date to 5/2/26

Steve

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Decoene Pieter (rEvo) <Pieter@revo-rebreathers.com>
Date: Wed, 29 Oct 2025 at 19:58
Subject: RE: [EXT] New price list for the 8010006 rEvo CR22D oxygen sensor
To: Steve Nixon <steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com>

Good evening Steve,

Thanks for the reminder, this was indeed on my desk

See attached for January and februari

Can you work with that?

 

Thx

 

Pieter

rEvo rebreathers

 

From: Steve Nixon [mailto:steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com]
Sent: woensdag 29 oktober 2025 11:53
To: Decoene Pieter (rEvo) <Pieter@revo-rebreathers.com>
Subject: Re: [EXT] New price list for the 8010006 rEvo CR22D oxygen sensor

 

Hi Pieter

 

Do you have any idea of your initial 2026 oxygen sensor requirements, especially January. The
schedule is getting tighter.

 

 

Regards

 

Steve
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On Mon, 13 Oct 2025 at 17:19, Decoene Pieter (rEvo) <Pieter@revo-rebreathers.com> wrote:

thank you Steve,

noted

will get back to you on early 2026 requirements

 

br

Pieter

revo rebreathes

 

From: Steve Nixon [mailto:steve.nixon@viamed.co.uk]
Sent: maandag 13 oktober 2025 16:42
To: Decoene Pieter (rEvo) <Pieter@revo-rebreathers.com>
Subject: [EXT] New price list for the 8010006 rEvo CR22D oxygen sensor

 

This message is from an EXTERNAL SENDER – be CAUTIOUS, particularly with links and attachments

 

Dear Pieter

 

Please find attached a new price list for the 8010006 rEvo CR22D oxygen sensor, to be effective as
of 1st January 2026. This replaces the existing price list dated 8th July 2022.

 

Previously we have offered three pricing levels, these have been reduced to just two to be more
flexible for rEvo: Qty 50-99, Qty 100+

 

Your existing orders are as follows:

Qty 600   November  4536012618

Qty 400   November  4536012650

Qty 600   December  4536012619

 

In view of the Christmas and New Year holidays, can you please advise your oxygen sensor
requirements for January as soon as possible.

 

--

Steve
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Steve Nixon

Director - Viamed Ltd.

 

Office:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

 

 

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

.

 

--

 

 

Steve

 

 

Steve Nixon

Managing Director - Vandagraph Sensor Technologies Ltd.

 

Office:  +44 (0)1535 634900

Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

--
 
 
Steve
 
 
Steve Nixon
Managing Director - Vandagraph Sensor Technologies Ltd.

Office:  +44 (0)1535 634900
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267
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