10/29/25, 7:41 AM Gmail - Re: QUOTATION FOR OOM112 OXYGEN SENSOR

Nl Gma|l Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>
Re: QUOTATION FOR OOM112 OXYGEN SENSOR

1 message

GEMS Medical System <gemsmedicalsystem@gmail.com> 28 October 2025 at 15:44

To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Dear Kate
Kindly send Proforma Invoice for proceeding with payments.

Thanks and Regards
Rani Ebinesar

On Tue, 28 Oct 2025 at 16:06, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Thank you Rani,

Please see attached quotation as requested. It is valid for 30 days. If you would like me to change it to a
proforma invoice, please let me know.

| have used the addresses as follows:

Delivery Address Invoice Address

GEMS Medical System GEMS Medical System

No 5 First Floor Appasamy Salai No 5 First Floor Appasamy Salai
Poonjolai Road Poonjolai Road

Poonga Nagar Poonga Nagar

Tiruvallur Tamil Nadu Tiruvallur Tamil Nadu

602001 602001

India India

Kind regards

Kate Giriffiths
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Check out our product portfolio at:
www.viamed.co.uk/productportfolio

Meet us at MEDICA 2025:
17th — 20th November, Disseldorf
UK Pavilion — Hall 16, Stand H03-1

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b587 1a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1847163716128700934%7Cmsg-f:1847240990385467460...
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Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to
be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call 44 (0)1535 634542

On Tue, 28 Oct 2025 at 10:37, GEMS Medical System <gemsmedicalsystem@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Kate,

Thank you for your email !!
Requesting you to quote alternative 5 x 0110043 (R-43V).
Please make special discount offer for the same.
Include shipping charges in the invoice.
Kind Regards
Rani Ebinesar
On Tue, 28 Oct 2025 at 13:11, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good morning Rani,
Thank you for your email.
Please could | advise you that part number 0110578 is a non stock item (approximately 8-10 week
lead time). We can also supply an equivalent, the R-43V, part number 0110043 which we expect to
be available late November. | have attached a technical specification sheet for the R-43V.
Would you like a quotation for 5 x 0110578 or the alternative 5 x 0110043 (R-43V)?
Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.
http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
Check out our product portfolio at:

www.viamed.co.uk/productportfolio

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b587 1a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1847163716128700934%7Cmsg-f:1847240990385467460... 2/3
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Meet us at MEDICA 2025:
17th — 20th November, Diisseldorf
UK Pavilion — Hall 16, Stand HO03-1

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call 44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, 27 Oct 2025 at 19:16, GEMS Medical System <gemsmedicalsystem@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Janine/Kate,

Greetings from GEMS Medical System !!
Requesting you to send quotation for the below mentioned item with special discount offer:

1. OOM112 OXYGEN SENSOR (PACK OF 2)
Part Number: 0110578

REF: E1002778
Quantity: 5 Nos

Shipping Address:

GEMS MEDICAL SYSTEM

NO :5, First Floor, Appasamy salai, Poonjolai road, Poonga Nagar, TIRUVALLUR - 602001
TAMIL NADU, INDIA

GSTN:33ASJPR5863P12V

Mobile :+91 73970 79807

Looking forward to hearing from you soon !!

Thanks & Regards
Rani Ebinesar

Senior Manager
GEMS Medical System
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