
Aqib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed2@gmail.com>

Fwd: [External Mail] Re: afh
Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk> Tue, Sep 9, 2025 at 12:18 PM
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>, Aqib Majeed <aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Hi, please can we provide Anish with a quotation for the following items including carriage charges:

10x 0014752 SpO2 Silicone Finger Sensor - Adult = USD $120 each EXW
10x 0014753 SpO2 Silicone Finger Sensor - Paediatric = USD $120 each EXW

Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

Check out our product portfolio at:
www.viamed.co.uk/productportfolio

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Anish Mathew <anishmathew@mpmct.com>
Date: Tue, 9 Sept 2025 at 12:10
Subject: RE: [External Mail] Re: afh
To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Qty 10 each
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Best Regards,

Anish Mathew
Muscat Pharmacy & Stores LLC
P.O. Box ‑ 438 | Postal Code ‑ 100 | Muscat | Sultanate of Oman
P: +968 24814383 | M: +968 99417911 | F: +968 24816317
E: anishmathew@mpmct.com | Web: www.muscatpharmacy.om
   

Information contained and transmitted by this E-MAIL is proprietary to Muscat Pharmacy & Stores LLC and is intended for use only by the individual or entity to which it is addressed, and may
contain information that is privileged, confidential or exempt from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient you are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution or taking
action in reliance of the contents of this information is strictly prohibited. If you have received this email by error, please notify mphq@mpmct.com and delete this email from your system.
   

From: Ryan Swaine [mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk]
Sent: Tuesday, September 9, 2025 14:18
To: Anish Mathew <anishmathew@mpmct.com>
Subject: Re: [External Mail] Re: afh

 

Hi Anish

 

Please can you confirm if it is just one of each item or more?

 

Best regards

Ryan

 

 

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
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Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

 

Check out our product portfolio at:

www.viamed.co.uk/productportfolio

 

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

 

 

On Tue, 9 Sept 2025 at 11:00, Anish Mathew <anishmathew@mpmct.com> wrote:

For total qty  delivery to Muscat

 

   

Best Regards,

Anish Mathew

Muscat Pharmacy & Stores LLC

P.O. Box ‑ 438 | Postal Code ‑ 100 | Muscat | Sultanate of Oman

P: +968 24814383 | M: +968 99417911 | F: +968 24816317

E: anishmathew@mpmct.com | Web: www.muscatpharmacy.om
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Information contained and transmitted by this E-MAIL is proprietary to Muscat Pharmacy & Stores LLC and is intended for use only by the individual or entity to which it is addressed, and may contain information that is
privileged, confidential or exempt from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient you are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution or taking action in reliance of the contents of this information is strictly
prohibited. If you have received this email by error, please notify mphq@mpmct.com and delete this email from your system.

   

From: Ryan Swaine [mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk]
Sent: Tuesday, September 9, 2025 13:00
To: Anish Mathew <anishmathew@mpmct.com>
Cc: B. Muralidharan <muralidharan@mpmct.com>
Subject: Re: [External Mail] Re: afh

 

Hi Anish

 

Is it just one of each item?

 

Best regards

Ryan

 

 

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
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Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

 

Check out our product portfolio at:

www.viamed.co.uk/productportfolio

 

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

 

 

On Tue, 9 Sept 2025 at 07:26, Anish Mathew <anishmathew@mpmct.com> wrote:

Dear Ryan

 

Kindly add courier charge also from your end to Muscat pharmacy

So I can place the order

 

 

   

Best Regards,

Anish Mathew

Muscat Pharmacy & Stores LLC

P.O. Box ‑ 438 | Postal Code ‑ 100 | Muscat | Sultanate of Oman

P: +968 24814383 | M: +968 99417911 | F: +968 24816317
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E: anishmathew@mpmct.com | Web: www.muscatpharmacy.om

   

Information contained and transmitted by this E-MAIL is proprietary to Muscat Pharmacy & Stores LLC and is intended for use only by the individual or entity to which it is addressed, and may contain information that is
privileged, confidential or exempt from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient you are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution or taking action in reliance of the contents of this information is strictly
prohibited. If you have received this email by error, please notify mphq@mpmct.com and delete this email from your system.

   

From: Ryan Swaine [mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk]
Sent: Thursday, September 4, 2025 19:34
To: Anish Mathew <anishmathew@mpmct.com>
Cc: B. Muralidharan <muralidharan@mpmct.com>
Subject: [External Mail] Re: afh

 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

 

Hi Anish

 

I'm very well, thank you. I hope you are too.

 

Please find the pricing below:
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0014752 SpO2 Silicone Finger Sensor - Adult = USD $120 each EXW
0014753 SpO2 Silicone Finger Sensor - Paediatric = USD $120 each EXW

 

Best regards

Ryan

 

 

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

 

Check out our product portfolio at:

www.viamed.co.uk/productportfolio

 

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

 

 

On Thu, 4 Sept 2025 at 13:48, Anish Mathew <anishmathew@mpmct.com> wrote:

Hi Dear Rayan

 

Hope you doing well

 

I would like to have request a quotation from you for the below items

1.      14752

9/9/25, 12:30 PM Gmail - Fwd: [External Mail] Re: afh

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=18de0f2fa7&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f:1842784992091034703&simpl=msg-f:1842784992091034703 7/8



2.      14753

   

Best Regards,

Anish Mathew

Muscat Pharmacy & Stores LLC

P.O. Box ‑ 438 | Postal Code ‑ 100 | Muscat | Sultanate of Oman

P: +968 24814383 | M: +968 99417911 | F: +968 24816317

E: anishmathew@mpmct.com | Web: www.muscatpharmacy.om

   

Information contained and transmitted by this E-MAIL is proprietary to Muscat Pharmacy & Stores LLC and is intended for use only by the individual or entity to which it is addressed, and may contain information that is
privileged, confidential or exempt from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient you are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution or taking action in reliance of the contents of this information is
strictly prohibited. If you have received this email by error, please notify mphq@mpmct.com and delete this email from your system.
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