24/10/2025, 11:48 Gmail - Re[4]: Spare part

M Gma" Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re[4]: Spare part

1 message

Duikpunt <info@duikpunt.be> 24 October 2025 at 11:22
Reply-To: Duikpunt <info@duikpunt.be>
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Hello Ryan,

We would like to order the VN202 with DIN KIT.

Jurgen Peere

Duikpunt BV

Korte Molenstaat 55
8200 St. Andries/Brugge
+3250/314531
info@duikpunt.be

—————— Oorspronkelijke bericht ------

Van "Ryan Swaine" <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>
Aan "Duikpunt" <info@duikpunt.be>

Datum 22/04/2025 13:21:48

Onderwerp Re: Re[2]: Spare part

Hi Jurgen
Please find our trade price below:
VN202 with DIN KIT = GBP £142

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Tue, 22 Apr 2025 at 12:12, Duikpunt <info@duikpunt.be> wrote:
Hello Ryan,

The analyser and the DIN kit complete.
Can you send me the price so | can inform our customer?

Jurgen Peere

Duikpunt BV

Korte Molenstraat 55
8200 St. Andries/Brugge
+32 50/314531
Info@duikpunt.be
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—————— Oorspronkelijke bericht ------

Van "Ryan Swaine" <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>
Aan "Duikpunt" <info@duikpunt.be>

Datum 22/04/2025 11:59:07

Onderwerp Re: Spare part

Hi Jurgen
Thank you.

Can | clarify, are you wanting just the metal part of the din kit (circled) or are you
wanting the analyser and the Din Kit complete?

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Sat, 19 Apr 2025 at 14:22, Duikpunt <info@duikpunt.be> wrote:
Hello Ryan,

Can we order the parts that are on the pictures in attachment?

Jurgen Peere

Duikpunt BV

Korte Molenstaat 55
8200 St. Andries/Brugge
+3250/314531
info@duikpunt.be
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