
Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: Part price
1 message

Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> 20 October 2025 at 09:09
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Moss Gavin <Gavin.Moss@alderhey.nhs.uk>
Date: Mon, 20 Oct 2025 at 09:08
Subject: Part price
To: info@viamed.co.uk <info@viamed.co.uk>

Hi

 

Can you please confirm the price of the following part.

 

0110429 * Maxtec Oxygen Sensor MAX-250E.

 

We would need 5

 

Kind regards

 

Gavin Moss

Bio Medical Engineering

Alderhey Children's NHS Foundation Trust

Eaton Road

Liverpool

L12 2AP

 

Direct 3171

Ext 2118 opt 4

Tel 01512525293

Fax 01512525722
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