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M Gma" Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Re: Please send me up-to-date information on your sensors. ©
1 message

Megant LLC <megant.llc@gmail.com> Tue, Oct 7, 2025 at 3:41 PM

To: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Sophie,
Thank you for provide information to me.

Yes, Please send me an invoice for 2 x R-48V oxygen sensor (part number 0110579, Envitec OOM113, for Mindray SV300
ventilator).

| will pay this invoice as quickly as | receive it from you.©
After | have paid you, please send my order to the UK address you have already sent previous orders.

Delivery Address:

Oleksandr Pavliuk

Units 7, St. Martin's Way, Tooting
Nova Post 2 NP000527778
(Nova Poshta International)

St Martin's Way

London

Wimbledon

SW17 0JH

+447342235330

Many thanks in advance. @ ©

Kindest Regards,

Oleksandr Pavliuk

Director

MEGANT LLC

tel. +38 (096) 701-68-28

e-mail: megant.llc@gmail.com

website: https://www.megant.com.ua/
Telegram: https://t.me/MEGANT_LLC_bot
Kyiv, Ukraine

Please consider the environment before printing this email. ©

7 xoBT. 2025 p. 0 14:33 Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk> nuwe:

Good afternoon,
Thank you for your email. | am pleased to confirm the price list you have is still valid :)

If you would like to place an order, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Kind regards

Sophie Lines
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
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Email: sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk
Tel: 44 (0)1535 634 542
Fax: 44 (0)1535 635 582

Check out our product portfolio at:
www.viamed.co.uk/productportfolio

Meet us at MEDICA 2025:
17th — 20th November, Disseldorf
UK Pavilion — Hall 16, Stand H03-1

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call 44 (0)1535 634542

On Tue, Oct 7, 2025 at 11:51 AM Megant LLC <megant.llc@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Sophie,

| hope you feel good and you are healthy.

Please send me up-to-date pricing information for your oxygen sensors. Or should | continue to use the
prices you sent me previously (see attached file), which are the same as the prices | already paid for a

sensor from you this year? ©

Kindest Regards,
Oleksandr Pavliuk

tel. +38 (096) 701-68-28
Kyiv, Ukraine

Please consider the environment before printing this email.
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