
Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Oxygen Sensor OOM109-LF2
1 message

Ivar Donker <ivar.donker@relitech.nl> 7 October 2025 at 15:42
To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Can you arrange 10 pieces for me?
Thnx

Verzonden vanuit Outlook voor iOS

Van: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Verzonden: Tuesday, October 7, 2025 4:41:06 PM
Aan: Ivar Donker <ivar.donker@relitech.nl>
Onderwerp: Re: Oxygen Sensor OOM109-LF2
 
Good afternoon Ivar,

Thank you for your email.

Unfortunately, we have none in stock.  This is a non stock item.  The lead time is approximately 4-5 weeks.

Please let me know if you require any further assistance.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Check out our product portfolio at:
www.viamed.co.uk/productportfolio

Meet us at MEDICA 2025:
17th – 20th November, Düsseldorf
UK Pavilion – Hall 16, Stand H03-1

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to
be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
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If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call  44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------

On Tue, 7 Oct 2025 at 15:16, Ivar Donker <ivar.donker@relitech.nl> wrote:

Hi Kate,

 

I was wondering if you have any of these on stock; looking for some 5 or 10 pieces.

 

Envitec Oxygen Sensor OOM109-LF2

 

If so, can you send me a proforma for either 5 or 10 so that I can pay them?

 

 

 

Kind regards,
Ivar Donker

Relitech B.V.
van Siburgstraat 34
3863 HW Nijkerk
Tel:  +31 33 30333716

Mob:+31653983919
www.relitech.nl

 

No legal consequences can be derived from the contents of this e-mail neither is sender committed to these.
The content of this e-mail is exclusively intended for addressee(s) and information purposes. Should you
receive this message by mistake, you are hereby notified that any disclosure, reproduction, distribution or use
of this message is strictly prohibited. Sender accepts no liability for any damage resulting from the use and/or
acceptation of the content of this e-mail. Always scan attachments before opening them.
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