
Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Re: R-22A in Canada
1 message

Francois Brizard <francois.brizard@brp.com> Thu, Oct 2, 2025 at 3:15 PM
To: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Oh, that is great news.

I would like a quote for 4 x Part number 0110122 - R-22A Oxygen Sensor including shipping costs to :
BRP Valcourt
Att. François Brizard (plan 6)
565 De la Montagne
Valcourt, Québec, Canada
J0E 2L0

Also, with the intention of "trying not to go through the long process of opening an account", since this is only for a small
amount, can you tell me if BRP can pay by credit card? This would simplify and accelerate the whole transaction process
(and mean that I would be back in operation with that part faster !)

Let me know

Best regards

François Brizard, eng.
819-571-3252

On Thu, Oct 2, 2025 at 10:09 AM Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good afternoon, 

Thank you for your email. I can confirm we do have the R-22A Oxygen Sensor available, and also a couple of other
options which would be suitable for you as well. Please see details as follows:

Part number 0110122 - R-22A Oxygen Sensor. $39.80 USD each EXW (In stock)

Part number 0110132 - R-22AV Oxygen Sensor $39.80 USD each EXW (In stock)

Part number 0110182 - R-22AVG Oxygen Sensor $37.60 USD each EXW (In stock)

03/10/2025, 09:20 Gmail - Re: R-22A in Canada

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=d104de5290&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1844857068756283247%7Cmsg-f:1844879881172160… 1/3

https://mail.google.com/mail/?view=cm&fs=1&tf=1&to=sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk


If you would like me to send an official quote or Proforma Invoice, please let me know which sensor you would prefer and
how many you would require? I can also include shipping costs via our courier UPS.

Kind regards

Sophie Lines
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email: sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk
Tel:   44 (0)1535 634 542
Fax:   44 (0)1535 635 582

Check out our product portfolio at:
www.viamed.co.uk/productportfolio

Meet us at MEDICA 2025:
17th – 20th November, Düsseldorf
UK Pavilion – Hall 16, Stand H03-1

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete
in the subject line or call  44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------

On Thu, Oct 2, 2025 at 9:13 AM Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Francois Brizard <francois.brizard@brp.com>
Date: Wed, 1 Oct 2025 at 18:05
Subject: R-22A in Canada
To: <info@viamed.co.uk>

Hi,

We have a system which uses a R-22A oxygen sensor that just failed. 
The OEM assembly was made by Amium in Austria and they gave me the details about the part. 

Is there any chance you may have a distributor in Canada ? North America ?

Please let me know!
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Best regards 

Francois Brizard
Ingénieur émissions, Certification
Emission engineer, Certification

565 de la Montagne | Valcourt | Québec | Canada
T: 1-450-532-5100 x6697 M: 819-571-3252
brp.com

 

Le contenu de ce courriel est confidentiel et soumis à des droits d'auteur. Il est interdit de l'utiliser ou de le divulguer sans autorisation. Si
vous avez reçu cette transmission par erreur, nous vous prions de nous notifier immédiatement par retour de courriel. Merci.

The contents of this email are confidential with all rights reserved to the author. It is illegal to use or divulge this information without
authorization. If you have received this email by mistake, please notify us immediately by replying to the email. Thank you.
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