
Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Inquire for oxygen sensor
1 message

Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com> 30 September 2025 at 11:44
To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Kate,

Many thanks for your email, can you send a new proforma invoice for the 5 Pcs MAX-250TM Oxygen
sensors?

Best regards,

Sudath Weeraman
Prime Lanka Associate
Sri Lanka.

On Tue, Sep 30, 2025 at 4:04 PM Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good morning Sudath,

Thank you for your email.

No problem, we are happy to wait for the payments.

Part number 0110435 - MAX-250TM is currently in stock.  The date is June 2025.  The price is £80.70
each EXW.

Please let me know if I can be of any further assistance.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.
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On Tue, 30 Sept 2025 at 11:06, Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com> wrote:
Good morning Kate,

Stocks are available for the oxygen sensor model MAX-250TM
P/N-R125P18-012 (we have purchase order for the 5 pcs of above sensor)

Please give me more days for the settle pending payments

Thank you,
Best Regards,

Sudath Weeraman
Prime Lanka Associate
Sri Lanka.
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