29/09/2025, 14:58 Gmail - TR: PO 251540

M Gma" Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

TR: PO 251540

1 message
Sabine VALLENTIN <svallentin@aqualung.com> 24 September 2025 at 08:06

To: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>, Stephanie BOLLARO <sbollaro@aqualung.com>

Hi Ryan,

Please find attached the proof of payment for PO 251540 , would you please ship goods beginning of October if you
have the stock.

Please confirm.

Thank you .

Cordialement.

Best regards.

Sabine VALLENTIN
Group MP supply planner .
Military Professionnal Division

AQUALUNG GROUP

New direct line +33 422 532 623
300 rue du Vallon - Les Vaisseaux — Batiment C

06560 SOPHIA ANTIPOLIS — France

De : Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@yvandagraph.co.uk>
Envoyé : mardi 9 septembre 2025 18:27

A : Sabine VALLENTIN <svallentin@aqualung.com>
Objet : Re: PO 251540
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[This message is from an EXTERNAL SENDER - be CAUTIOUS, particularly with links and attachments]

Hi Sabine

Please find the amended proforma invoice attached.

Once it is paid, | will combine the two orders into one shipment.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Tue, 9 Sept 2025 at 15:52, Sabine VALLENTIN <svallentin@aqualung.com> wrote:

Hi Ryan

Please consolidate the shipment end of October with PO 251395.

Regarding VN202, we need the same already ordered in the last PO attached.

Please confirm me price and send me the modified Pl if necessary to ask payment in advance .

Thank you.

Cordialement.

Best regards.

Sabine VALLENTIN
Group MP supply planner .

Military Professionnal Division
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AQUALUNG GROUP

New direct line +33 422 532 623
300 rue du Vallon - Les Vaisseaux — Batiment C

06560 SOPHIA ANTIPOLIS — France

De : Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@yvandagraph.co.uk>
Envoyé : mardi 9 septembre 2025 16:40

A : Sabine VALLENTIN <svallentin@aqualung.com>
Cc : Stephanie BOLLARO <sbollaro@aqualung.com>
Objet : Re: PO 251540

[This message is from an EXTERNAL SENDER - be CAUTIOUS, particularly with links and attachments]

Hi Sabine

Thank you for your order.

The items are available from stock, | have added a shipping date for the last week in October, but we can ship
whenever it suits you.

| have added the VN202 with Manual off, as this is the model you have had most recently, please let me know if
you would prefer the Auto off version.

Prepayment is required, so please find your proforma invoice attached.

Please let me know if you have any questions.

Kind regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine
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General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Tue, 9 Sept 2025 at 14:56, Sabine VALLENTIN <svallentin@aqualung.com> wrote:

Hi Ryan,

Please find attached our new PO 251540, would you please send me the acknowledgment with the delivery date
confirmed .

Thank you.

Cordialement.

Best regards.

Sabine VALLENTIN
Group MP supply planner .
Military Professionnal Division

AQUALUNG GROUP

New direct line +33 422 532 623
300 rue du Vallon - Les Vaisseaux — Batiment C

06560 SOPHIA ANTIPOLIS — France
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