25/09/2025, 14:40 Gmail - R: Order no. 214/25

M G ma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

R: Order no. 214/25

2 messages

info@incasmed.com <info@incasmed.com> 25 September 2025 at 13:38
To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
We thank you very much for your availability.

Our request has been submitted to you as we are used to pay other suppliers by 30 days or 60 days
from the Invoice date, considering we are a reliable company.

This application is new for us and it entails a demanding commitment, therefore we thank you but we
prefer to pay you in advance as always.

In attachment the modified order no. 214/25.

Best regards,

Anna Apostoli
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IN.CAS. S.r.l. “Working Together for Safety”

Via Staffali 40/A 37062 Dossobuono di Villafranca (VR) Italy
Tel. +39 045 8601267 - int. 202

Fax +39 045 8601090

Web : www.incasmed.com www.incas-spriz.com
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Le informazioni contenute nella presente comunicazione e i relativi allegati possono essere riservate e sono, comunque, destinate
esclusivamente alle persone o alla Societa sopraindicati. La diffusione, distribuzione e/o copiatura del documento trasmesso da parte di
qualsiasi soggetto diverso dal destinatario ¢ proibita ai sensi del Regolamento Europeo 679/2016 (GDPR). Se avete ricevuto questo messaggio
per errore, vi preghiamo di distruggerlo e di informarci immediatamente per telefono allo 045/8601267 o inviando un messaggio all'indirizzo :
info@incasmed.com This e-mail is intended for the use of the addressee(s) only and may contain privileged, confidential, or
proprietary information that is exempt from disclosure under law. If you have received this message in error, please inform us promptly by
reply e-mail, then delete the e-mail and destroy any printed copy.

Da: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Inviato: giovedi 25 settembre 2025 14:08

A: info@incasmed.com

Oggetto: Re: Order no. 214/25

Hi Anna,

We would be happy to offer you a credit account with payment terms of 30 days from the invoice date. An
initial credit limit of €5,000 will be applied, which can be reviewed if necessary.

To finalise the setup, please complete the attached application form. Business references are not required.

Please could you also provide your company’s EORI number? In some cases, this is the same as the VAT
number.

Please see credit application attached.

We would be happy for this order to be on a credit basis.
Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd
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25/09/2025, 14:40 Gmail - R: Order no. 214/25
Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to
be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, 25 Sept 2025 at 10:34, <info@incasmed.com> wrote:
Yes, please let us know if our request can be accepted.

Then | would be happy to adjust the order based on the price you provide.

Kind regards,

Anna Apostoli
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Via Staffali 40/A 37062 Dossobuono di Villafranca (VR) Italy

Tel. +39 045 8601267 - int. 202
Fax +39 045 8601090

Web : www.incasmed.com www.incas-spriz.com

Le informazioni contenute nella presente comunicazione e i relativi allegati possono essere riservate e sono, comunque, destinate
esclusivamente alle persone o alla Societa sopraindicati. La diffusione, distribuzione e/o copiatura del documento trasmesso da parte di
qualsiasi soggetto diverso dal destinatario ¢ proibita ai sensi del Regolamento Europeo 679/2016 (GDPR). Se avete ricevuto
questo messaggio per errore, vi preghiamo di distruggerlo e di informarci immediatamente per telefono allo 045/8601267 o inviando
un messaggio all'indirizzo : info@incasmed.com This e-mail is intended for the use of the addressee(s) only and may contain privileged,
confidential, or proprietary information that is exempt from disclosure under law. If you have received this message in error, please inform
us promptly by reply e-mail, then delete the e-mail and destroy any printed copy.

Da: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Inviato: giovedi 25 settembre 2025 11:20

A: info@incasmed.com

Oggetto: Re: Order no. 214/25

Thank you Anna,

| do not need an updated order, | have not received a reply from our accounts director yet. Are you
happy for me to wait to see if this order can be on a credit account?

For some reason it looks like your last order had incorrect prices on, | am not sure how this happened,
but thank you for confirming you accept the correct prices.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
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Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted
to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, 25 Sept 2025 at 09:58, <info@incasmed.com> wrote:

Dear Kate,

We're fine with it, but please note that we have applied the prices from your latest order
confirmation (attached).

Would you like to receive the updated order?

I look forward to your kind feedback.

Best regards,

Anna Apostoli
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L'impress di orescere.

IN.CAS. S.r.l. “Working Together for Safety”

Via Staffali 40/A 37062 Dossobuono di Villafranca (VR) Italy
Tel. +39 045 8601267 - int. 202

Fax +39 045 8601090

Web : www.incasmed.com www.incas-spriz.com

Le informazioni contenute nella presente comunicazione e i relativi allegati possono essere riservate e sono, comunque, destinate
esclusivamente alle persone o alla Societa sopraindicati. La diffusione, distribuzione e/o copiatura del documento trasmesso da parte di
qualsiasi soggetto diverso dal destinatario ¢ proibita ai sensi del Regolamento Europeo 679/2016 (GDPR). Se avete ricevuto
questo messaggio per errore, vi preghiamo di distruggerlo e di informarci immediatamente per telefono allo 045/8601267 o inviando
un messaggio all'indirizzo : info@incasmed.com This e-mail is intended for the use of the addressee(s) only and may
contain privileged, confidential, or proprietary information that is exempt from disclosure under law. If you have received this message
in error, please inform us promptly by reply e-mail, then delete the e-mail and destroy any printed copy.

Da: Kate Griffiths <kate.qgriffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Inviato: giovedi 25 settembre 2025 10:46

A: info@incasmed.com

Oggetto: Re: Order no. 214/25

Good morning Anna,

Thank you for your order. | am just waiting for a reply from our accounts director about your credit
account request.
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Please could | ask if you accept the correct pricing as follows:
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The prices have not changed since your last order. | look forward to your reply.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the
office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where
possible.

E-mail Disclaimer
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
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If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, 25 Sept 2025 at 09:11, <info@incasmed.com> wrote:

Good morning Kate,

Please find enclosed our order no. 214/25.

We kindly ask you to if it would be possible to extend the payment terms to 30 days from the
invoice date, in line with our ongoing collaboration.

Thank you for your understanding

Best reagrds,

Anna Apostoli
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IN.CAS. S.r.l. “Working Together for Safety”

Via Staffali 40/A 37062 Dossobuono di Villafranca (VR) Italy
Tel. +39 045 8601267 - int. 202

Fax +39 045 8601090

Web : www.incasmed.com www.incas-spriz.com
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Le informazioni contenute nella presente comunicazione e i relativi allegati possono essere riservate ¢ sono, comunque, destinate
esclusivamente alle persone o alla Societa sopraindicati. La diffusione, distribuzione e/o copiatura del documento trasmesso da parte
di qualsiasi soggetto diverso dal destinatario ¢ proibita ai sensi del Regolamento Europeo 679/2016 (GDPR). Se avete ricevuto
questo messaggio per errore, vi preghiamo di distruggerlo e di informarci immediatamente per telefono allo 045/8601267 o inviando
un messaggio all'indirizzo : info@incasmed.com This e-mail is intended for the use of the addressee(s) only and may
contain privileged, confidential, or proprietary information that is exempt from disclosure under law. If you have received
this message in error, please inform us promptly by reply e-mail, then delete the e-mail and destroy any printed copy.
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Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> 25 September 2025 at 14:35
Draft To: info@incasmed.com
Bcc: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

Thank you for letting me know Anna, please see attached proforma invoice as requested.
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to
be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

[Quoted text hidden]
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