25/09/2025, 09:04 Gmail - Re: Request for Quotation — V1000 Foetal Heart Simulator

M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>
Re: Request for Quotation — V1000 Foetal Heart Simulator

1 message

Adrian Gheorghica <adrian.gheorghica@liamed.ro> 25 September 2025 at 08:35

To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Kate,

| would like to confirm that | have received approval from our Director to proceed with the purchase.

Kindly ask you to provide invoice so that | can forward it to our finance department for payment
processing.

Best regards,

Adrian GHEORGHICA - Responsabil logistica service

LIAMED/ () | scusweosr.
B-dul. Grivitei Nr. A8 Brasov - 500182 Romania
APARATURA MEDICALA [ BRASOV TellFax: +4 0268 327 490 Mob:+4 0739 885 387

adrian.gheorghica@liamed.ro  www.liamed.ro

De la: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Trimis: luni, 22 septembrie 2025 11:09

Catre: Adrian Gheorghica <adrian.gheorghica@liamed.ro>
Subiect: Re: Request for Quotation — V1000 Foetal Heart Simulator

Good morning Adrian,

Thank you for letting me know.
Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

Itis intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
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25/09/2025, 09:04 Gmail - Re: Request for Quotation — V1000 Foetal Heart Simulator

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, 22 Sept 2025 at 06:55, Adrian Gheorghica <adrian.gheorghica@liamed.ro> wrote:
Good morning,

| am awaiting approval from the director. After approval, | will return with a firm order to you by
Friday.

King regards,

Adrian GHEORGHICA — Responsabil logistica service

LIAMED/ (©) SC LIAMED SRL

B-dul. Grivitei Nr. A8 Brasov - 500182 Romania
APARATURA MEDICALA f BRASOV TellFax: +4 0268 327 490 Mob:+4 0739 885 387

adrian.gheorghica@liamed.ro  www.liamed.ro

De la: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Trimis: miercuri, 17 septembrie 2025 11:38

Catre: Adrian Gheorghica <adrian.gheorghica@liamed.ro>; lonut Mihalcea <ionut.mihalcea@liamed.ro>
Subiect: Re: Request for Quotation — V1000 Foetal Heart Simulator

Good morning,

Just a quick email to ask if quotation QVM158643 is still required? It expires next Friday, 26th September at
which time | will delete it.

Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Giriffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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25/09/2025, 09:04 Gmail - Re: Request for Quotation — V1000 Foetal Heart Simulator

On Wed, 10 Sept 2025 at 12:00, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good afternoon,

Just a quick email to ask if quotation QVM158643 is still required?
Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Tue, 26 Aug 2025 at 11:15, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good morning Adrian,

Thank you for your email.

Please see attached quotation as requested. It is valid for 30 days. These are currently in stock. Please let
me know if you would like me to change the quotation to a proforma invoice.

Kind regards

Kate Giriffiths
http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer
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25/09/2025, 09:04 Gmail - Re: Request for Quotation — V1000 Foetal Heart Simulator

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Tue, 26 Aug 2025 at 09:19, Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Adrian Gheorghica <adrian.gheorghica@liamed.ro>
Date: Tue, 26 Aug 2025 at 08:43

Subject: Request for Quotation — V1000 Foetal Heart Simulator
To: info@viamed.co.uk <info@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: lonut Mihalcea <ionut.mihalcea@liamed.ro>

Hello,

We kindly ask you to provide us with a quotation for V1000 Foetal Heart Simulator.

Please note that we have previously purchased two ( units of this product from your company,
and we would now like to acquire an additional unit.

We would appreciate it if you could include in your offer:

- the price per unit
- delivery time and shipping costs

Please also specify if it has a calibration certificate.
Thank you in advance for your support. We look forward to receiving your quotation.

Best regards,

Adrian GHEORGHICA — Responsabil logistica service

LIAMED/ (©) | scusueose.
B-dul. Grivitei Nr. A8 Brasov - 500182 Romania
APARATURA MEDICALA f BRASOV TellFax: +4 0268 327 490 Mob:+4 0739 885 387

adrian.gheorghica@liamed.ro  www.liamed.ro

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1841505382211999035%7Cmsg-f:1844220503967325...  4/4
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