
Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: o2 Sensor Order
1 message

Dive-In Larnaca <larnaca@dive-in.com.cy> 15 September 2025 at 10:39
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Good afternoon Ryan, 

We hope this email finds you well and is still in use? 

We are looking to place an order for 2 new R-33DE Oxygen Sensors, are you able to help us with this?

Best Regards,

 

Dive-In Team

Tel/fax: +357 24 627 469

Mob/Whatsapp: +357 99 279 829

 

larnaca@dive-in.com.cy

www.dive-in.com.cy

On Sat, Jan 4, 2025 at 12:08 PM Dive-In Larnaca <larnaca@dive-in.com.cy> wrote:
Hi Ryan,

Happy New Year.

Sorry, I thought the transfer ws made. Will do it ASAP

Best Regards,

 

Dive-In Team

Tel/fax: +357 24 627 469

Mob/Whatsapp: +357 99 279 829

 

larnaca@dive-in.com.cy

www.dive-in.com.cy
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On Fri, Jan 3, 2025 at 5:52 PM Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Philip

Please accept my best wishes for the new year.

We have a proforma invoice on our system for you, please can you let me know if it is still valid and if so please can you let me know when you
will be making the payment?

I look forward to hearing from you.

Kind regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Fri, 13 Dec 2024 at 12:52, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Philip

Please find your amended proforma invoice attached.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Fri, 13 Dec 2024 at 12:06, Dive-In Larnaca <larnaca@dive-in.com.cy> wrote:
Hi Ryan,

As it's only gbp6 please go ahead and add the ups delivery.

Best Regards,

 

Dive-In Team

Tel/fax: +357 24 627 469

Mob/Whatsapp: +357 99 279 829

 

larnaca@dive-in.com.cy
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www.dive-in.com.cy

On Fri, Dec 13, 2024 at 1:55 PM Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Philip

Thank you very much.

Please find your proforma invoice attached. 
I have added the delivery with Airmail, as it is the most economical method, but it can take a good few weeks, sometimes longer. If you
need the sensors sooner, we can offer UPS, this would be an additional £6 (£22 total). Please let me know if you would like me to amend it
to UPS or if there are any other changes required.

Our bank details are listed at the bottom of the invoice for when you are happy to proceed, alternatively we can send you a link if you would
prefer to make a card payment. For this I would require your full name.

Is Hannah Baker and Sheri Keeble still working with you? If not, I will remove their names from our database.

Thank you and best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Fri, 13 Dec 2024 at 11:35, Dive-In Larnaca <larnaca@dive-in.com.cy> wrote:
Hi Ryan,

Yes, that is the correct address.

Thank you for your prompt reply and help.

Best Regards,

 

Dive-In Team

Tel/fax: +357 24 627 469

Mob/Whatsapp: +357 99 279 829

 

larnaca@dive-in.com.cy

www.dive-in.com.cy
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On Fri, Dec 13, 2024 at 1:01 PM Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Philip 

Thank you very much for your email.

We would be happy to supply you.
Please can you confirm if we have your company address correct:
Dive-In Larnaca
Lordos Seagate Block A, 
Tasos Mitsopoulos Avenue, (Formerly Piale Pasa), 
Larnaca, , 6027, Cyprus

Are we delivering to your billing address? In the past we have sent your orders to a UK address, which we are happy to do, but it
would incur the UK tax.

I will await your reply.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Fri, 13 Dec 2024 at 07:11, Dive-In Larnaca <larnaca@dive-in.com.cy> wrote:
Hi Ryan,

My name is Philip, and I'm the new Ops manager at Dive-In Larnaca. The business has changed hands on the 1st of Sept 2024, so
I do not know if I'm talking to the correct person.

Is it possible to order 

1 x 

R-33DE Oxygen Sensor (0110224)

1 x 

R-22AT Oxygen Sensor (0110238)

Thank you in advance.

Best Regards,

 

Dive-In Team

Tel/fax: +357 24 627 469

Mob/Whatsapp: +357 99 279 829
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