
Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: Request for O2 analysers
1 message

Free Dive Zone Free Dive Zone <mnourkabbani@hotmail.com> 11 September 2025 at 04:48
To: "ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk" <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Hello Rayan sorry for my late reply and for settithe payment. Can we change the payment link as I need to add one
extra
Awaiting your reply 
Mohamed Kabbani

On 9 Sep 2025, at 14:02, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> wrote:

Dear Mohamed

I hope this email finds you well.

I just wanted to check with you to see if the proforma invoice and payment link is still valid or should we
delete them?

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Fri, 29 Aug 2025 at 11:15, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Mohamed

Please find the link below:

https://app.squareup.com/pay-invoice/invtmp:90c7344b-d53e-48dc-b234-61382a90e7e8

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Thu, 28 Aug 2025 at 18:54, Free Dive Zone Free Dive Zone <mnourkabbani@hotmail.com>
wrote:

Hello 
Yes please send me a payment link 
Thanks 
Mohamed Kabbani
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On 28 Aug 2025, at 17:52, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> wrote:

﻿
Dear Mohamed

Thank you very much, it is nice to hear from you.

Please find your proforma invoice attached.
If you would like to pay by card, I can send you a payment link or give you a call for
your details.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Thu, 28 Aug 2025 at 15:12, Free Dive Zone Free Dive Zone
<mnourkabbani@hotmail.com> wrote:

﻿
﻿ Dear Ryan,

I hope this email finds you well. Do you remember me from my last order placed in
July 2022 (attached)?

Here are the details of a new order I would like to place with you, please let me
have your quote mentioning your best prices and earliest delivery date including
courier fees to Beirut. Do you accept VISA credit cards for payment?

7910201    Oxygen Analyser Tek-Ox + Quick-Ox    3pcs
0110217    Oxygen sensor R-17VAN    1pc

Looking forward to your reply.
Regards 
Mohamed Kabbani

<MAN158708.pdf>
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