
Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re[2]: order
1 message

Diving Equipement <contact@divingequipement.com> 9 September 2025 at 14:14
Reply-To: Diving Equipement <contact@divingequipement.com>
To: "ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk" <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Hi Ryan,

thank you. I've just paid the invoice.
I've forgot to tell you that my delivery address has changed.

Please send parcel to 

Diving Equipement
NORDBOX
57 rue Victo Baltard 
59200 Tourcoing 
FRance

The other address can not receive package.

Thank you

------ Message d'origine ------
De "Ryan Swaine" <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>
À "Diving Equipement" <contact@divingequipement.com>
Date 09/09/2025 12:13:49
Objet Re: order

Dear Mickael

Thank you very much for your order.
Please find your proforma invoice attached and your payment link below:

https://app.squareup.com/pay-invoice/invtmp:eaf21b92-f7d8-40f1-a760-1b328de90fad

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
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Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Tue, 9 Sept 2025 at 10:06, Diving Equipement <contact@divingequipement.com> wrote:
Hi Ryan,

can you send me an 7910101 VN202 MKII Analyser please?

Thank you
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