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M Gma" Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: Vandagraph Ltd - Trade Price List valid from 1st March 2023

1 message

S Stoyan <pdtdiver@hotmail.com> 3 September 2025 at 06:43
To: "ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk" <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Hello Rayan

Lets try again the shipment to Bulgaria, | am very sorry to make you make all this changes.

We have also changed our Dive Center address. Now we are located on Parvi May 21.

I am not sure, how | made the payment the last time. Paying with bank card or PayPal is a the easier
option for me.

Below is the correct an updated address.

Stoyan Stamov
Diving Center Sozopol
Parvi May 21
Sozopol, 8130
Bulgaria

Thank you in advance for your time Rayan.
Best regards

Stoyan, +359 885 245 526

Diving Center Sozopol
www.dive-sozopol.com

'MypKaHe n WwHopxenuHr ¢ BogonaseH
ueHTbp Cosonon | BogonaseH
LleHtbp Cosonon

MypKaHe 1 WHopXxenuHr ¢ BogonaseH uyeHtbp Co3onon e
cb3ganeH npes3 2014 r. ot CtosH CTamMoB, KOWTO e
MEHWNAXBP W rNaBeH MHCTPYKTOP Ha BOAOA3HUA LEeHTbP.

www.dive-sozopol.com

From: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Sent: September 1, 2025 2:49 AM

To: S Stoyan <pdtdiver@hotmail.com>

Subject: Re: Vandagraph Ltd - Trade Price List valid from 1st March 2023

Dear Stoyan

Thank you and please find a copy of your proforma invoice attached.
Please can you check | have the address details correct.
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If you are happy to proceed, you can make your payment to the bank details at the bottom of the invoice or | can send
you a link if you would prefer to pay by card.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Fri, 29 Aug 2025 at 17:39, S Stoyan <pdtdiver@hotmail.com> wrote:
Hello Rayan

Thank

you for your quick response.

Last time problem was in the Bulgarian posts.
| will go for the option to be shipped to the UK address.

Thank

you for the honest advise to purchase just one sensor

Best regards

Stoyan

Sent from my iPhone

On Aug 29, 2025, at 7:27 pm, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> wrote:

Dear Stoyan Stamov
Thank you for your email.

I understand your concerns with airmail, we have encountered numerous issues with this service, so
we now try to use UPS within mainland Europe. We have secured some reasonable rates, so please
see the costs below for both options:

Delivery to UK:
R-17VAN = £38
Postage £7

Local VAT (20%) = £9
Total = GBP £54

Delivery to Bulgaria:

R-17VAN = £38

UPS = £15

Total = GBP £53

(with this option it is probable that you will have to pay your local VAT and possibly a customs
administration charge prior to delivery)

In regards to ordering a second sensor, this is your choice but we would not recommend it. We
recommend that sensors are put into use within 6 months of purchase. Although the sealed
packaging prolongs the life of the sensor, it does not stop it working altogether.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
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On Fri, 29 Aug 2025 at 16:51, S Stoyan <pdtdiver@hotmail.com> wrote:
Hello

| hope this email nfinds you well

This is Stoyan from Diving Center Sozopol.

| purchased a Vandgraph 02 analizer from you 2 years ago and | am very happy with it.
The oxygen sensor however will soon need to be replaced. For ordering | have 2
options,one is to be shipped directly to Bulgaria, however that got a bit coplicated last
time due to issues with the bulgarian posts. Option 2 is to have it shipped to an UK
address and from there to be shipped to Bulgaria. Second option has less burocrasi,
however would take a bit longer as from the UK address will be shipped to Bulgaria.
Considering that shipping cost for one oxygen sensor would be the same as for 2, | may
order 2 sensor. | would think that if the second one stay in a vacum pack it will last for a
few years.

This is the sensor | need - R-17VAN Oxygen Sensor (0110217)

Please let me know what would be the price to be shipped to Bulgaria and a shipping
option to;

Stoyan Stamov APLUS7465

Unit 8 , Optima park, Thames road, Section 7465

Dartford, Kent DA1 4QX

United Kingdom

+44 7466 795655

Thank you in advance for your time
Best regards,

Stoyan, +359 885 245 526

Diving Center Sozopol
www.dive-sozopol.com

From: Vandagraph Ltd <sales@vandagraph.co.uk>

Sent: February 10, 2023 3:58 AM

To: MMERGE4 <pdtdiver@hotmail.com>

Subject: Vandagraph Ltd - Trade Price List valid from 1st March 2023

Vandagraph Pricing Update (10/02/2023)

View this email in your browser

&) VANDAGRAPH

Please find below links to the Vandagraph Trade and Retails Price List for
your reference.

Retail price lists are valid as of immediate effect, whereas the new trade
prices will not be valid until 1st March 2023.

Should you have any queries or further questions please do not hesitate in
contacting us.
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Regards
Catrin Hollings
Marketing

Copyright © 2023 Vandagraph Ltd, All rights reserved.
You are receiving this email as we believe these products will be of interest to you.

Our mailing address is:
Vandagraph Ltd
15 Station Road
Cross Hills, Keighley, West Yorkshire BD20 7DT
United Kingdom

Add us to your address book
Tel: +44(0)1535 634900

Want to change how you receive these emails?
You can update your preferences or unsubscribe from this list
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