8/14/25, 4:31 PM

M Gmail

Gmail - Re: Viamed Invoice RVM157921-1 Reference VIAWEB1215

Agib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed2@gmail.com>

Re: Viamed Invoice RVM157921-1 Reference VIAWEB1215

Perth Hyperbaric <enquiries@perth-hyperbaric.org.uk>
To: Aqib Majeed <aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>

It's 259815 ES

Thanks
Sandy

On 13/08/2025 09:41 BST Aqgib Majeed <aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hello

Good morning

Thank you for your email to my colleague Zoey.

| am sorry to hear about the sensor that is not working.
Can you please send me the Serial number of this sensor.
Kind regards

Agib Majeed

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: agib.majeed@yviamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Wed, Aug 13, 2025 at 3:45 PM

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be

answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=18de0f2fa7 &view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f:1840351899927451060&dsqt=1&simpl=msg-f:1840351899927451060
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