
Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Fwd: [Request ID :##478087##]: Re: Official Purchase Order from George Eliot NHS
Trust - 210103760
1 message

Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Tue, Aug 12, 2025 at 12:03 PM
To: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Purchasing <purchasing@geh.nhs.uk>
Date: Tue, 12 Aug 2025 at 12:01
Subject: Re: [Request ID :##478087##]: Re: Official Purchase Order from George Eliot NHS Trust - 210103760
To: <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: <catherine.clewley@geh.nhs.uk>

Hi Kate,

I have now amended the order which has gone for re-authorisation, as soon as this has been done then an amended order
will automatically email out to yourselves.

Kind Regards,
Irene Simpkins 
Foundation Group Shared Services - Procurement  

------Original request below-------

Description:
hi Catherine 

Would you like me to amend the price on PO to one stated on email 

The EyeMax range costs £56.70 each pack of 20.

1114005 -  EyeMax 2 Neonatal Phototherapy Mask Regular Occipital - Frontal Circumference: 32 -
38 cm      £56.70 each pack of 20.
1114006 -  EyeMax 2 Neonatal Phototherapy Mask Premie Occipital - Frontal Circumference: 26 - 32
cm       £56.70 each pack of 20.
1114007 -  EyeMax 2 Neonatal Phototherapy Mask Micro Occipital - Frontal Circumference: 20 - 26
cm          £56.70 each pack of 20.

As the PO has them at £55.30. 

Regards,
Stacey Randle 
Foundation Group Shared Services - Procurement  

------Original request below-------

Description:
Good afternoon,

Thank you for your PO 210103760.

Please could I advise you of incorrect pricing?

The EyeMax range costs £56.70 each pack of 20.
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1114005 -  EyeMax 2 Neonatal Phototherapy Mask Regular Occipital - Frontal Circumference: 32 -
38 cm      £56.70 each pack of 20.
1114006 -  EyeMax 2 Neonatal Phototherapy Mask Premie Occipital - Frontal Circumference: 26 - 32
cm       £56.70 each pack of 20.
1114007 -  EyeMax 2 Neonatal Phototherapy Mask Micro Occipital - Frontal Circumference: 20 - 26
cm          £56.70 each pack of 20.

Please let me know if you would like me to proceed.

I can see that you have paid the correct price in July 2025 on PO 210102216.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk [viamed.co.uk]
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd [twitter.com]
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the
office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where
possible.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy [viamed.co.uk]
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------

On Tue, 5 Aug 2025 at 14:57, Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: <geh.integra@nhs.net>
Date: Tue, 5 Aug 2025 at 14:50
Subject: Official Purchase Order from George Eliot NHS Trust - 210103760
To: <orders@viamed.co.uk>

Please find attached a Purchase Order from George Eliot NHS Trust for goods/services to be
provided by VIAMED.

Please view the attachment for details of the goods/services required.
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When submitting invoices for payment, please ensure to use the email address shown on the
purchase order.

*** PLEASE DO NOT REPLY TO THIS EMAIL AS THE EMAIL BOX IS UNMONITORED, PLEASE
USE THE DETAILS SHOWN ON THE PURCHASE ORDER ***

Thank You
Procurement Department

Regards,

Regards,

DISCLAIMER: This e-mail, and any files transmitted with it, are confidential and intended solely for the use of the individual
to whom it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient please destroy this message, delete any copies held on your
systems, and notify the sender immediately. You should not retain copy or use this e-mail for any purpose, nor disclose all or
any part of its content to any other person.
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