
Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: good evening im interested for oxygen sensor R-33DE and viamed oxygen
sensor R-41V how much does this cost?
1 message

Marios Pavlou <mariosdpavlou@gmail.com> 4 August 2025 at 12:44
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Ok im interested for 6X R-33DE
and 1X R-41V

On Mon, 4 Aug 2025 at 11:45, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Marios

Thank you for your email.

R-33DE = GBP £53 each EXW
R-41V = GBP £38 each EXW

Both are available from stock.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Sun, 3 Aug 2025 at 19:15, Marios Pavlou <mariosdpavlou@gmail.com> wrote:

On Tue, 9 Apr 2024 at 15:18, Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Marios

Thank you!

Please find your proforma invoice attached.
All of the items are available from stock.

Please let me know if you have any questions.

Kind regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Tue, 9 Apr 2024 at 13:01, Marios Pavlou <mariosdpavlou@gmail.com> wrote:
Good evening Ryan
I want to order 1X0110224 oxygen sensor R-33D
2X0110041 viamed oxygen sensor R-41v
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