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M G ma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>
AW: Account 00007016

1 message

Bettina WeiR <bw@medprod.de> 4 August 2025 at 10:06

To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Kate,

Thank you for the quick reply.

We agree with the price

and look forward to delivery.

Kind regard

Bettina Weil}

Mit freundlichen GriRen

Bettina Weill
Administrator

medpro Deutschland GmbH

Jahnstr. 13 | 58455 Witten
Telefon: +49 2302 97353-24

E-Mail: bw@medprod.de

Web: www.medprod.de

Sitz der Gesellschaft: Witten
Geschéftsfiihrer: Bjorn Schmitt
Handelsregister: Amtsgericht Bochum, HRB 22049

Diese E-Mail kann vertrauliche oder rechtlich geschiitzte Informationen enthalten. Falls Sie diese Nachricht irrtiimlich erhalten
haben, informieren Sie uns bitte und I6schen Sie sie umgehend.
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Von: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Gesendet: Montag, 4. August 2025 10:55

An: Bettina WeiRl <bw@medprod.de>

Betreff: Re: Account 00007016

Good morning Bettina,

Thank you for your order.

Please see order confirmation below. Carriage will be added at time of invoice. These are currently in
stock. Please let me know if you are happy with the price and | will proceed.

Qe T
Delivery Address Invoice Address Contact Tel - 004923020735324
Medpro Deutschland Gmbh Medpro Deutschland Gmbh
Jahnstrabe 13 Jahnstrabe 13 Account 00007018
“SNBISISE g\é‘:gg Customer Reference  04082584KG
Germ\any German% Dz.ne. 04 Aug 2025

VAT DE309557373 Priority 8
. . riced In US Dollars
Order Confirmation CVM1 58255 Page 1

CIP Carriage and Insurance Paid To Medpro Deutschland, Germany * Incoterms(R) 2020
Your Viamed Contact for this Order Confirmation : kate griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Item Reference Description Quantity Unit Unit Vat Total
2520000 Microstim DB3 - Patient Lead 10 18.72 0.00 187.20
Tariff 90181990-00 .
CoO United Kingdom Press Studs - Cable Length: 0.90m
Setof 2
INS Insurance 1 12.50 0.00 12.50
PPUPSB UPS Courier Delivery - Standard 1 0.00 0.00 0.00

Total Net: 199.70
Total Vat: 0.00
Total: 199.70

I look forward to your reply.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
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Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to
be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, 4 Aug 2025 at 09:42, Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Bettina Weil <bw@medprod.de>
Date: Mon, 4 Aug 2025 at 09:32

Subject: Account 00007016

To: info@viamed.co.uk <info@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Sir or Madam,

We would like to order 10 Microstim DB3 patient cables, Cable length 0,90 m. item no. 252000.

Please send me an answering machine.

Thank you and have a nice week.
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With Kind regards

Bettina Weil}

Mit freundlichen GriRen

Bettina Weil}
Administrator

medpro Deutschland GmbH

Jahnstr. 13 | 58455 Witten
Telefon: +49 2302 97353-24

E-Mail: bw@medprod.de

Web: www.medprod.de

Sitz der Gesellschaft: Witten
Geschéftsfiihrer: Bjérn Schmitt
Handelsregister: Amtsgericht Bochum, HRB 22049

Diese E-Mail kann vertrauliche oder rechtlich geschiitzte Informationen enthalten. Falls Sie diese Nachricht irrtimlich
erhalten haben, informieren Sie uns bitte und |6schen Sie sie umgehend.
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