8/1/25, 3:26 PM Gmail - Re: [EXT] Re: temperature probe adaptors

M Gmall Agib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed2@gmail.com>

Re: [EXT] Re: temperature probe adaptors

Steve Nixon <steve.nixon@viamed.co.uk> Fri, Aug 1, 2025 at 3:22 PM
To: office@vmsecure.me.uk

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: lan Mercer <lan.Mercer@penlon.com>
Date: Fri, 1 Aug 2025 at 11:47

Subject: RE: [EXT] Re: temperature probe adaptors
To: Steve Nixon <steve.nixon@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Steve,
Yes they appear to do so.

Our tech dept wants some more to finalise testing at our end.

Could | order 5 of them via a cash sale?
| can pay via my own credit card to save time?

[Quoted text hidden]
[Quoted text hidden]

[Quoted text hidden]
[Quoted text hidden]

If you can please let me know the batch quantities required, we will be pleased to provide a quotation.

[Quoted text hidden]

On steve.hardaker@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

[Quoted text hidden]
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