7121125, 1:25 PM Gmail - Fwd: 02 sensors

M Gmall Agib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed2@gmail.com>

Fwd: 02 sensors

Raj Johal <raj.celtechonline@gmail.com> Mon, Jul 21, 2025 at 1:13 PM
To: Agib Majeed <viamed.aqgib.majeed2@gmail.com>

Hi

Yes please get it done, | have to say | don't think Steve used to, however it's fine.
Thanks

Raj

On Mon, 21 Jul 2025, 13:12 Agib Majeed, <viamed.aqib.majeed2@gmail.com> wrote:
Hello Raj

Good afternoon

We are in wait for 25 x R-17A-LVG to fulfill your order, if you want we can possibly part ship your order of what we have in stock and the rest later when it arrives.
| do need to advise though this will cost you another carriage charge.

Please let me know if you would like a part shipment and accept that you will pay the second carriage for it.
Kind regards

Aqib Majeed
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be
answered, but please continue to use email where possible.
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