10/07/2025, 14:47 Gmail - Re: Request for a Oxygen Sensor

M Gma" Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>
Re: Request for a Oxygen Sensor

1 message

Andrea Pierfederici <andpierf@gmail.com> 10 July 2025 at 14:12

To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Hello Ryan

I am sending you the copy of the payment, i must specify that the address you have to send the product is Sunbay
park hotel, Via Aurelia Sud Km 68.500 Civitavecchia (RM);
Thanks for your cooperation,

Greetings
Andrea

Andrea Pierfederici

Istruttore responsabile

Blue< Shark

DIVING CENTER

T. +39 339 5314956

centro immersioni - formazione subacquea - riparazione attrezzature
show room DiveSystem

Blue Shark Diving 2

CF 91079340583

P.iva 16231641008

Via Orti della Paola 25

00052 Cerveteri (Roma)

Sede operativa e spedizione

c/o Mercure Civitavecchia Sunbay Park Hotel
Via Aurelia Sud km 68.500

00053 Civitavecchia

Il giorno gio 10 lug 2025 alle ore 11:42 Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> ha scritto:
Dear Andrea

Please find your proforma invoice attached, our bank details are listed at the bottom of the invoice.
| have used the details from your previous orders, please let me know if there are any amendments required.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Wed, 9 Jul 2025 at 14:13, Andrea Pierfederici <andpierf@gmail.com> wrote:
Hello Ryan
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Thank you Ryan, you can send me the estimated cost in GBP with your bank details and then | will proceed with
the bank transfer.

Greetings,
Andrea
Andrea Pierfederici

Istruttore responsabile

Blue< Shark

DIVING CENTER

T. +39 339 5314956

centro immersioni - formazione subacquea - riparazione attrezzature
show room DiveSystem

Blue Shark Diving 2

CF 91079340583

P.iva 16231641008

Via Orti della Paola 25

00052 Cerveteri (Roma)

Sede operativa e spedizione

c/o Mercure Civitavecchia Sunbay Park Hotel
Via Aurelia Sud km 68.500

00053 Civitavecchia

Il giorno mer 9 lug 2025 alle ore 15:02 Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> ha scritto:
Dear Andrea

Unfortunately we only have a GBP account. | can't tell you what you would be charged for the conversion into
EUR, for this you would have to speak to your bank.

If you wanted to pay by card, we would charge your card at GBP and then it would appear as EUR on your
account statement, your bank will conduct the conversion at their current rate.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Wed, 9 Jul 2025 at 13:40, Andrea Pierfederici <andpierf@gmail.com> wrote:
Good afternoon,

I'm sorry if | disturb you, but | really need to buy two of these products as soon as possible;
Unfortunately we can't proceed with any transition without an estimate of the cost in euro.

| hope to hear from you soon;
Andrea

Andrea Pierfederici

Istruttore responsabile

Blue< Shark

DIVING CEMTER

T. +39 339 5314956

centro immersioni - formazione subacquea - riparazione attrezzature
show room DiveSystem

Blue Shark Diving 2
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00052 Cerveteri ( Roma)
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Sede operativa e spedizione

c/o Mercure Civitavecchia Sunbay Park Hotel
Via Aurelia Sud km 68.500

00053 Civitavecchia

Il giorno ven 4 lug 2025 alle ore 12:59 Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> ha scritto:
Dear Andrea

Thank you for your email.

The R-17VAN is GBP £38 EXW
We have them available from stock.

Carriage would be GBP £14

Please let me know if you would like to proceed with an order and if you would prefer to pay by credit card
or bank transfer.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Fri, 4 Jul 2025 at 10:51, Andrea Pierfederici <andpierf@gmail.com> wrote:
Greetings,
| would like to make an order for an Oxygen Sensor Class R-17VAN,
please contact me if there are any available and for the price;

Best Regards
Andrea Pierfederici

Andrea Pierfederici

Istruttore responsabile

Blue< Shark

DIVING CENTER

T. +39 339 5314956

centro immersioni - formazione subacquea - riparazione attrezzature
show room DiveSystem

Blue Shark Diving 2

CF 91079340583

P.iva 16231641008

Via Orti della Paola 25

00052 Cerveteri ( Roma )

Sede operativa e spedizione

c/o Mercure Civitavecchia Sunbay Park Hotel
Via Aurelia Sud km 68.500

00053 Civitavecchia

ﬂ Bonifico SEPA - EBM18 (4).pdf
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