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Nl Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>
Fwd: R-17MED Oxygen Sensor Part Number: 0110017

1 message

Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> 7 July 2025 at 13:57

To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>
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717/25, 2:10 PM Gmail - Fwd: R-17MED Oxygen Sensor Part Number: 0110017

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Richard Wilkes <Richard.Wilkes@cobalthealth.co.uk>
Date: Mon, 7 Jul 2025 at 13:54

Subject: R-17MED Oxygen Sensor Part Number: 0110017
To: info@viamed.co.uk <info@viamed.co.uk>

Good afternoon

Is it possible to provide a quote for the above part in order for me to raise a PO and pay via
invoice please?

Kind Regards

> i
C//Z:é‘f’(’ T 01213718034 (ITM)
o T 01242 431333 (Operations Hub)

. i
Richard Wilkes E richard.wilkes@cobalthealth.co.uk

MRI Research Superintendent
Institute of Translational Medicine
Imaging Centre

Next leave: 20t - 23rd June
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Cobalt Health is a registered charity no. 1090790. Company limited by guarantee, registered
in England and no. 4366596. Registered office: Linton House Clinic, Thirlestaine Road,
Cheltenham, Glos GL53 7AS. Telephone 01242 535900. Fax 01242 263733.
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