71725, 11:45 AM Gmail - Re: Flow Sensors

M Gma“ Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Flow Sensors
1 message

A M <6385208@gmail.com> 4 July 2025 at 17:53
To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Hello.

Could you please send us a payment invoice with best possible discount for:
- Spirotrue A flow sensor. Not autoclavable. Viamed PN 4310007. Original Bluepoint PN 1030132006. 5/pk - 100
packs

Delivery address:

Kosov Alexey,

Groote Wischen 6, Hamburg 21147
+49 176 6215 2557

Thank you in advance.

Best regards.

On Thu, 23 Jan 2025 at 15:23, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good morning,

Thank you for your payment.

Please see attached order confirmation.

This order has a lead time of approximately 2-3 weeks.

We will email a tracking number when the goods leave our warehouse.
Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b587 1a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1735535910601617497%7Cmsg-f:1836736082507251944...  1/18



