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M Gma" Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>
Re: Vandagraph Invoice RAN157257-1 Reference 11062513RS

1 message

Arvin Maremark <arvin@maremark.ee> 2 July 2025 at 09:23

To: accounts@vandagraph.co.uk
Cc: Michael Lamb <michael.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk>, Tago Moldau <tago@maremark.ee>, Merike <merike@maremark.ee>

Hello

We just found out all 4 completes are missing the white part that goes between analyzer and the blue part. | added the
picture of our own analyzer that has it
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Best regards
Arvin Aitaja

On 16. Jun 2025, at 14:31, Arvin Aitaja <arvin@maremark.ee> wrote:

Hello
We have new bank card, here is the information so you could take the money.

Tago Moldau

Telant Service OU
5478826000103366
07/27

504

Best regards

Arvin Aitaja

Maremark Sukeldumiskeskus
Web: www.maremark.ee

Tel: +372 5371 9647

<image003.png>

On 13. Jun 2025, at 13:10, Michael Lamb <michael.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk> wrote:
Please find attached Vandagraph Invoice(s) RAN157257-1.pdf

Should you have any queries please do not hesitate to contact us at
accounts@vandagraph.co.uk

Kind regards

Michael Lamb
Office Administrator
Vandagraph Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email: michael.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: 44 (0)1535 634 900

Fax: 44 (0)1535 635 582

Facebook Page: facebook.com/VandagraphLtd

Company registered in England, No. 02332105.
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E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.vandagraph.com/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call 44 (0)1535 634900

<RAN157257-1.pdf>
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