
Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: Order VANWEB2302 Tracking RV920512140GB
1 message

Udi Hakim <udi.hakim@gmail.com> 25 June 2025 at 18:24
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Hello,
I would like to order: 
5 X R-17 Oxygen Sensor. 

Thank you
Udi Hakim 

On 5 Sep 2024, at 18:51, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> wrote:

Dear Udi

Thank you for your order and email.

We would be happy to supply you on a trade basis. 
Please find our trade prices and some product information attached.

If and when you are ready to place an order, please email us with your request and we will provide you
with a proforma invoice. Payment can be made via bank transfer or we can send you a link where you
can make a card payment.

Just to let you know, the TEK-OX is readily available, but we have some delays on the production of the
VN202; the manual off version is available from stock, but the auto off version is currently delayed and
could be a few months before it is available.

I look forward to hearing from you and please let us know if you have any further questions.

Kind regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Tue, 3 Sept 2024 at 22:41, Udi Hakim <udi.hakim@gmail.com> wrote:
Thank you,
Is it possible to get a dealer's price list? 
I sell a lot of Analyzers and can buy sensors in bulk. 

Thank you,
Udi Hakim
Tactical Diving Solutions 
tacdiving.com

On Tue, 3 Sep 2024 at 21:06 Michael Lamb <michael.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Udi Hakim,

I am writing to inform you that your order, VANWEB2302 has been dispatched.
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You can track your order on the Royal Mail website, www.royalmail.com, with the following tracking
number RV920512140GB.     

Please see attached delivery note,  DAN151990-1 and Invoice RAN151990-1 .

Kind Regards 

Michael Lamb
Vandagraph Ltd
michael.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk

<Vandagraph Trade Price list - March 2024.pdf><TEK-OX Specification Sheet 2024-02-13.pdf><VN202
mkII Spec Sheet 2024-02-13.pdf><Vandagraph Oxygen Sensors Leaflet 2024-03-04 (email).pdf>
<Oxygen Sensors for Analox Analysers.pdf><Quick-Ox.pdf><DIN Kit 2017-05-30.pdf>
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