20/06/2025, 10:22 Gmail - RE: Brand Médical Duffusion Order number CF00000325

M G mMa |I Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

RE: Brand Médical Duffusion Order number CF00000325

1 message
Secretariat <secretariat@brandmedicaldiffusion.fr>

To: Kate Giriffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Frederic Jouven <frederic.jouven@brandmedicaldiffusion.fr>

Kate,

Yes we accept.
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20 June 2025 at 10:21

02 37 62 10 00

secretariat@
brandmedicaldiffusion.fr

www.brandmedicaldiffusion.fr

15b rue de I'Ancienne ,
28 380 Saint Rémy sur Avre

De : Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Envoyé : vendredi 20 juin 2025 10:49

A : Secretariat <secretariat@brandmedicaldiffusion.fr>

Cc : Frederic Jouven <frederic.jouven@brandmedicaldiffusion.fr>
Objet : Re: Brand Médical Duffusion Order number CF00000325

Good morning Coralie,
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Thank you for your order.

Please could | ask if you accept the pricing as follows:

CIP Carriage and Insurance Paid To Brand Medical Diffusion, France * Incoterms(R) 2020
Your Viamed Contact for this Order Confirmation : kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Item Reference Description Quantity  Unit Unit Vat Total
1114005 EyeMax 2 Neonatal Phototherapy Mask - Regular 18 50.80 0.00 914 40
Tariff 9018199000
CoO Mexico Ref. R300P01
Pack of 20
1114006 EyeMax 2 Neonatal Phototherapy Mask - Premie 8 50.80 0.00 406.40
Tariff 9018199000
Ca0 Mexico Ref. R300P02
Pack of 20
1114007 EyeMax 2 Neonatal Phototherapy Mask - Micro 8 50.80 0.00 406.40
Tariff 9018199000
Ca0 Mexico Ref. R300P03
Pack of 20

| await your reply.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer
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GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be

taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with

delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Fri, 20 Jun 2025 at 09:24, Secretariat <secretariat@brandmedicaldiffusion.fr> wrote:

Dear Kate,

Please accept this new order and send the products at your earliest conveniance.

Best regards,

Coralie GERMAIN

| Brand Medical Diffusion

Assistante administrative et commerciale
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02 37 62 10 00

secretariat@
brandmedicaldiffusion.fr

www.brandmedicaldiffusion.fr

15b rue de I'Ancienne ,
28 380 Saint Rémy sur Avre
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