
Aqib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed2@gmail.com>

Fwd: Meeting with Bio BT - India
Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk> Tue, Jun 17, 2025 at 11:02 AM
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>, Aqib Majeed <aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Hi, please can we set up on the CRM and send a proforma invoice as follows:

EUR - Distributor

Company: Bio BT
support@biobt.in
0091 9216955612

Address:

Bio BT
1012, Jlpl Industrial Area
Sector 82
Mohali
Punjab
140306
India

Contact: Ajay Kumar - Manager
biobtinfo@gmail.com
0091 9216955612

4x OOM109-LF2 - 0110566

Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117
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---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>
Date: Tue, 17 Jun 2025 at 09:24
Subject: Meeting with Bio BT - India
To: By way of ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: <ryan.swaine@vmsecure.me.uk>

Skhwinder Singh - CEO

OEM II

Wanting initially for sleep studies machine
Pricing may be an issue
Was previously using BCI module

OOM109-LF2

Set up and send proforma invoice for available stock (x4)
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