
Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: VN202
1 message

Sales Oceandive <sales@oceandive.dk> 11 June 2025 at 16:43
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

hi Ryan 

Did you see my email? I am not asking for the price to hustle just because I do not remember the volume discounts.
The customer placed the order for the set with VN202, so we definitely need to get some things in :) 

Have a great evening

kr CHris

On Wed, 11 Jun 2025 at 11:39, Sales Oceandive <sales@oceandive.dk> wrote:
hello Ryan 

Thank you, extending my mutual wishes for you. :) 

This is the price for 3 sets correct, ie best price possible? 
Do you have the sensors for the Analox handheld unit on stock as well, just one, 
Plus the best price for 3 TEKOx as well.. 

kr Chris

On Wed, 11 Jun 2025 at 10:59, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Chris

I hope you are keeping well.

Please find your proforma invoice attached, we have the items available for an immediate shipment.

Please let me know once you have made the payment, if you would like me to send you a secure link for card
payments or if you have any questions.

Kind regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Tue, 10 Jun 2025 at 14:32, Sales Oceandive <sales@oceandive.dk> wrote:
hi Ryan 

hope you are well. Do you have this for immediate delivery plus a few units more of the TekOx 

O2 Analyzer MK2 VN202 m/QuickOx og DIN300 fitting

--
--
Ocean Divers ApS
Peter Bangsvej 18
2000 Frederiksberg 
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