11/06/2025, 10:33 Gmail - Re: New order

M Gma" Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: New order
1 message

Arvin Aitaja <arvin@maremark.ee> 11 June 2025 at 09:42

To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Cc: Tago Moldau <tago@maremark.ee>

Hello

Yes, send us the proformalinvoice and please try do send it out asap.

Best regards

Arvin Aitaja

Maremark Sukeldumiskeskus
Web: www.maremark.ee

Tel: +372 5371 9647

-v‘

On 11. Jun 2025, at 11:34, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Arvin

Thank you for your email.
We can aim to ship today, should | treat your email as an order?

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Wed, 11 Jun 2025 at 08:21, Arvin Aitaja <arvin@maremark.ee> wrote:
Hello

I need 4x 7910201 analyser. How fast can you send it out, we are in a little hurry with them?

Best regards

Arvin Aitaja

Maremark Sukeldumiskeskus
Web: www.maremark.ee

Tel: +372 5371 9647

W
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