
Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Order 5-2025
1 message

operations@azmedicslebanon.com <operations@azmedicslebanon.com> 13 May 2025 at 10:05
To: accounts@viamed.co.uk

Dear Gents,

I hope you are doing fine.

I kindly ask you to send me your best commercial price for the following
oxygen sensors:
1- OOM111-M ( or equivalent lowest price) Qty: 4
2- R22MEDV or equivalent ( lowest price) Qty: 8
3- R22MED or equivalent ( lowest price) Qty: 5
4- MAX 550E Qty: 4
5- R-42V or equivalent ( lowest price) Qty: 2
6- OOM113 or equivalent (lowest price) Qty: 5

Thank you in advance for your prompt reply,

P.S: Kindly when we confirm the order we need the newest production date
items.

Regards

-----Original Message-----
From: accounts@viamed.co.uk <accounts@viamed.co.uk>
Sent: Friday, June 16, 2023 1:58 PM
To: operations@azmedicslebanon.com
Subject: Viamed Ltd. Invoice(s) RVM143956-1

Please find attached invoice(s) from Viamed Ltd.

Should you have any queries please do not hesitate in contacting us.
accounts@viamed.co.uk

Regards
Accounts Department
Viamed Ltd
accounts@viamed.co.uk

Please do not reply to this Email as it is unmonitored.
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