5/12/25, 2:12 PM Gmail - Fwd: INQUIRY R-17MED

M Gmall Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: INQUIRY R-17MED

1 message

Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk> 12 May 2025 at 14:09
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Kate, please can you take care of this one?
Incoterms must be CIP or CPT depending on if they require insurance?

Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Nick Vardatsikos <nv@nivaco.gr>

Date: Mon, 12 May 2025 at 13:59

Subject: INQUIRY R-17MED

To: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>, NIVACO INFO <info@nivaco.gr>

Dear Ryan

| have a customer that wants 2 sensors R-17MED , for the VIAMED oximeters MX300-1

Knowing our frustration with DDP handling, please send to me a draft proforma invoice of the cost of the
two units, including freight to present it to our customs people so as to find out an estimation of the
clearance cost at our side.

Thanks

Regards

Nick

Nikolaos Vardatsikos

Evias 2, Marousi 15125, Greece
t: +30 2108069726

m: +30 6932410902

e: nv@nivaco.gr
www.nivaco.gr

Nivaco

ENTERPRISES
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