08/05/2025, 12:10 Gmail - Re: SS-DIV-480(39491)

M Gma" Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: SS-DIV-480(39491)

1 message

abe loh <abe@nordico-services.com>
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Cc: Tiffany B <admin@nordico-services.com>

Hi Ryan,
Can you please change the delivery address to,

Nordico Services Singapore C/O

Shelf Subsea Solutions Pte Ltd

(TOLL)

23G Loyang Crescent

Block 603 TOPS Avenue 6 #01-02
Singapore 509023

Use this email for all future correspondence.

Thanks

Best regards,

Abe Loh
Nordico Services Singapore
+65 93886902

On Thu, 8 May 2025 at 17:18, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Abe

Thank you.
Please find a copy of your proforma invoice and the payment link below:

https://app.squareup.com/pay-invoice/inv:0-ChB75SnQLFt6iiSwhchqHbJdEIgN

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Thu, 8 May 2025 at 09:54, abe loh <abe@nordico-services.com> wrote:
Hi Ryan,
Ok no worries...
Send me a payment link for 10 PCS.
Thanks.

8 May 2025 at 10:35

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=7e81c75fe0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:18314575175454096 18%7Cmsg-f:1831544514796584...
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08/05/2025, 12:10 Gmail - Re: SS-DIV-480(39491)
Best Regards,

Abe Loh
Nordico Services Singapore
+6593886902

On Thu, 8 May 2025 at 16:52, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Abe

Our replacement for the GOEL 370 is the R-17VAN.
R-17VAN = GBP £38 each EXW
Unfortunately we can not offer a better price.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Thu, 8 May 2025 at 03:36, abe loh <abe@nordico-services.com> wrote:
Hi Ryan,
Following up on this request.

Best regards,

Abe Loh
Nordico Services Singapore
+65 93886902

On Wed, 7 May 2025 at 18:33, abe loh <abe@nordico-services.com> wrote:
Hi Ryan,
Goel 370 Oxygen sensors.
Any better price for 10 more pcs?

Please use this email for all future correspondence.
Thanks.

Best regards,

Abe Loh
Nordico Services Singapore
+65 93886902

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=7e81c75fe0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:18314575175454096 18%7Cmsg-f:1831544514796584...
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